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HB 448  
 

Short Description:  LABOR REL-FINANCIAL ABILITY 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jeanne M Ives 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act. Provides that if a unit of local government, as an 
employer, and public employees provide for arbitration of impasses, the employer's financial ability to 
fund the proposals based on existing available resources shall be given primary consideration, provided 
that such ability is not predicated on an assumption that lines of credit or reserve funds are available or 
that the employer may or will receive or develop new sources of revenue or increase existing sources of 
revenue. Provides that in interest arbitration for security employee, peace officer, and fire fighter disputes, 
the arbitration panel shall take the employer's financial ability to fund the proposals based on existing 
available resources as the primary consideration, provided that such ability is not predicated on an 
assumption that lines of credit or reserve funds are available or that the employer may or will receive or 
develop new sources of revenue or increase existing sources of revenue (currently the interests and 
welfare of the public and the financial ability of the unit of government to meet those goals). Amends the 
Illinois Educational Labor Relations Act. With respect to collective bargaining between an educational 
employer (other than the Chicago school district) and an exclusive representative of its employees, 
provides that when making wage and benefit determinations during interest arbitration, the employer's 
financial ability to fund the proposals based on existing available resources shall be given primary 
consideration, provided that such ability is not predicated on an assumption that lines of credit or reserve 
funds are available or that the employer may or will receive or develop new sources of revenue or 
increase existing sources of revenue. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/31/2017 House Rule 19(a) / Re-referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 813  
 

Short Description:  EMPLOYMENT-LAYOFF NOTICE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jay Hoffman and Katie Stuart 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Worker Adjustment and Retraining Notification Act. Redefines "employer" to mean 
any business or enterprise that employs 65 or more (rather than 75 or more) employees, excluding part-



time employees; or 65 or more (rather than 75 or more) employees who in the aggregate work at least 
2,600 (rather than 4,000) hours per week (exclusive of hours of overtime). Provides that an employer may 
not order a mass layoff, relocation, or employment loss unless, 90 (rather than 60) days before the order 
takes effect, the employer gives written notice of the order to certain persons. Effective immediately. 

  Fiscal Note (Dept. of Commerce & Economic Opportunity) 

  

It is anticipated that House Bill 813 would increase the number of formal Workforce Adjustment and 
Retraining Notification Act (WARN) notices that are submitted to the Department of Commerce and 
Economic Opportunity. The Department's Office of Employment and Training (OET) estimates that 
an additional ½ to 1 full-time equivalent staff member would be required to support the Department's 
WARN notice and Rapid Response responsibilities. The salary, benefits and associated overhead 
costs for one full-time position is estimated at $160,000. 

 

  State Mandates Fiscal Note (Dept. of Commerce & Economic Opportunity) 

  This bill does not create a State mandate.  

 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/6/2018 House Held on Calendar Order of Second Reading - Standard Debate 

 

 
HB 2394  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-IN-STATE STUDENT AID 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Elizabeth Hernandez-Jehan Gordon-Booth-La Shawn K. Ford-Theresa Mah-André Thapedi, 
Gregory Harris, Michael J. Zalewski, Will Guzzardi, Emanuel Chris Welch, Cynthia Soto, Kelly M. 
Cassidy, Robyn Gabel, Silvana Tabares, Elaine Nekritz, Linda Chapa LaVia, Ann M. Williams, Barbara 
Flynn Currie, Sara Feigenholtz, Robert Martwick, Juliana Stratton, Daniel J. Burke, Camille Y. Lilly and 
Sonya M. Harper 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities in Illinois and the Higher 
Education Student Assistance Act. Provides that notwithstanding any other provision of law to the 
contrary, a student who meets the requirements concerning being deemed an Illinois resident for tuition 
purposes is eligible to apply or receive consideration for any student aid or benefit funded or administered 
by the State, State agencies, public institutions, or the university, including scholarships, grants, awards, 
stipends, room and board, tuition waivers, or other financial or in-kind assistance, but excluding Monetary 
Award Program grants. Prohibits each university and the Illinois Student Assistance Commission from 
denying a scholarship, grant, or loan to a person who has been convicted of illegal possession or sale of 
cannabis, controlled substances, or methamphetamine if he or she otherwise qualifies for the scholarship, 
grant, or loan. 
 



House Floor Amendment No. 2 
     Removes provisions in various Acts related to the governance of public universities in Illinois 
concerning qualifications for financial aid. Removes similar language in the Higher Education Student 
Assistance Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  11/8/2017 House Third Reading - Standard Debate - Lost 040-057-003 

 

 
HB 2771  
 

Short Description:  HEALTHY WORKPLACE ACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Christian L. Mitchell-Camille Y. Lilly-LaToya Greenwood-Elizabeth Hernandez-Mary E. Flowers, 
Barbara Flynn Currie, Silvana Tabares, Robyn Gabel, Gregory Harris, Sonya M. Harper, Carol Ammons, 
Cynthia Soto, Daniel J. Burke, Kathleen Willis, Stephanie A. Kifowit, Emanuel Chris Welch, Martin J. 
Moylan, Robert Martwick, Kelly M. Cassidy, Litesa E. Wallace, Ann M. Williams, Melissa Conyears-Ervin, 
Lou Lang, Natalie A. Manley, Elgie R. Sims, Jr., Luis Arroyo, Theresa Mah, William Davis, Jaime M. 
Andrade, Jr., Anna Moeller, Jay Hoffman, Justin Slaughter, Arthur Turner, Michael Halpin, Linda Chapa 
LaVia, Frances Ann Hurley, Juliana Stratton, Daniel V. Beiser, Sam Yingling, Laura Fine, Sara 
Feigenholtz, Michelle Mussman, Deb Conroy, Jehan Gordon-Booth, Marcus C. Evans, Jr. and Al Riley 
 
Senate Sponsors 
(Sen. Toi W. Hutchinson-Iris Y. Martinez-Daniel Biss, Ira I. Silverstein, Terry Link, Heather A. Steans, 
David Koehler, Melinda Bush-Mattie Hunter, Donne E. Trotter, Emil Jones, III-Kimberly A. Lightford, Don 
Harmon, Patricia Van Pelt, Jacqueline Y. Collins, Martin A. Sandoval, Antonio Muñoz, Omar Aquino, 
Thomas Cullerton and Cristina Castro) 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Healthy Workplace Act and amends the State Finance Act. Requires employers to 
provide specified paid sick days to employees. Sets forth the purposes for and manner in which the sick 
days may be used. Contains provisions regarding employer responsibilities, unlawful employer practices, 
and other matters. Provides that the Department of Labor shall administer the Act. Authorizes the 
imposition of civil penalties. Authorizes individuals to file civil actions with respect to violations. Creates 
the Healthy Workplace Fund as a special fund in the State treasury. Effective immediately. 
 
House Committee Amendment No. 1 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause with provisions similar to the introduced bill, with the 
following changes. Provides an exemption for the construction industry. Excludes school districts, park 
districts, and certain City of Chicago sister agencies. Provides for a minimum of 5 sick days rather than a 
maximum of 7 sick days per year. Changes the accrual rate and minimum usage. Provides that an 
employee may earn sick days 180, rather than 120, days after beginning employment. Effective 
immediately. 

  Fiscal Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Dept. of Labor) 



  

The Department currently employs 6 wage claim specialists and 2 clerical staff to process and 
administer wage claims under the Wage Payment and Collection Act. This legislation would require, 
the Department to add at least 4 full time staff members to process, answer phone calls and emails, 
and investigate additional claims. Also, at least one additional attorney position to review the 
additional claims for legal sufficiency and to ensure that the proper responsible parties are named. In 
addition, two administrative law judges would also be needed to handle the increase in the number of 
administrative hearings as a result of the additional claims. There are other administrative costs, 
including postage, office supplies and new employee IT equipment and licensing. Fiscal Impact = 
$843,000 (7 Headcount = $785,000; Administrative Costs = $58,000). 

 

  
Balanced Budget Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Office of Management and 
Budget) 

  

The Balanced Budget Note Act does not apply to this bill as it is not a supplemental appropriation 
that increases or decreases appropriations. Under the Act, a balanced budget note must be prepared 
only for bills that change a general funds appropriation for the fiscal year in which the new bill is 
enacted. 

 

  
Housing Affordability Impact Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Housing 
Development Authority) 

  
This bill will have no effect on the cost of constructing, purchasing, owning, or selling a single-family 
residence. 

 

  
Pension Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Government Forecasting & 
Accountability) 

  This legislation will not impact any public pension fund or retirement system in Illinois. 

 

  Judicial Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Admin Office of the Illinois Courts) 

  This legislation would neither increase nor decrease the number of judges needed in the State. 

 

  
State Debt Impact Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Government Forecasting & 
Accountability) 

  
This legislation would not change the amount of authorization for any type of State-issued or State-
supported bond, and, therefore, would not affect the level of State indebtedness. 

 

  Correctional Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Dept of Corrections) 



  This legislation has no fiscal or population impact on the Department of Corrections.  

 

  
State Mandates Fiscal Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Dept. of Commerce & 
Economic Opportunity) 

  This bill does not create a State mandate.  

 

  
Home Rule Note, House Committee Amendment No. 1 (Dept. of Commerce & Economic 
Opportunity) 

  This bill does not pre-empt home rule authority. 

 
Senate Committee Amendment No. 1 
     Specifically identifies entities included within the scope of the term "employer". Excludes certain 
railroad employees. Provides that a healthcare provider includes persons determined under the Family 
and Medical Leave Act of 1993, as of the effective date of this Act, to be a healthcare provider. Provides 
that an employer does not have to allow use more than 40 hours of paid sick time, rather than 5 paid sick 
days, annually. 
 
Senate Floor Amendment No. 2 
     Provides that the term "employee" does not include certain persons subject to the Railway Labor Act, 
the Railroad Unemployment Insurance Act, and the Federal Employers' Liability Act. Includes 
chiropractors within the scope of the term "healthcare provider". Removes requirement that a healthcare 
provider not be employed by an employer to whom the healthcare provider issues certifications. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/24/2018 House Placed on Calendar Order of Concurrence Senate Amendment(s) 1, 2 

 

 
HB 3185  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Carol Ammons 
 
Senate Sponsors 
(Sen. Scott M. Bennett) 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Universities Civil Service Act. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning 
temporary appointments. 



 
House Committee Amendment No. 1 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the State Universities Civil Service Act. 
Removes references to the abolished State Community College of East St. Louis. Removes outdated 
provisions. Removes a requirement that vacancies be filled by promotion whenever practicable. Allows 
the Merit Board to issue subpoenas in the course of any investigation or hearing conducted pursuant to 
the Act. Removes the power of the Merit Board to set probationary periods of employment. Changes 
various references from "Director" to "Executive Director". Provides for the appointment of Designated 
Employer Representatives. Provides that the enumeration of specific duties and powers that the Merit 
Board may delegate to the Executive Director does not preclude the Merit Board from delegating other 
duties and powers. Allows the Merit Board to authorize the creation and use of pilot programs to further 
the goals of the Act. Allows examinations under the Act to be in various forms. Requires examinations in 
the same classification to be uniform, and provides for the waiver of examination requirements in 
specified circumstances. Makes changes to provisions concerning veteran preferences and active military 
service. Moves certain provisions concerning employees promoted in the promotional line and seniority. 
Makes changes concerning hearings on demotion, removal, or discharge. Expands nondiscrimination 
protections to include ancestry, age, marital status, order of protection status, disability, military status, 
sexual orientation, pregnancy, or unfavorable discharge from the military. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 2 
     With respect to the University Civil Service Merit Board, changes a reference from "chairman" to 
"chairperson". Removes duplicate language concerning examinations. Allows for the waiver of 
examination requirements for additional positions, entry level only (instead of just additional positions). 
Restores language that provides that employees in positions covered by the State Universities Civil 
Service Act who, while in good standing, leave to engage in military service during a period of hostility 
shall be given credit for seniority purposes for time served in the armed forces. Makes technical 
corrections. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/13/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 3rd Reading March 14, 2018 

 

 
HB 4027  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin-Patricia R. Bellock-Dan Brady-Michael P. McAuliffe, Tom Demmer, Michael D. Unes, 
David B. Reis, Steven A. Andersson, Peter Breen, Mike Fortner, Randy E. Frese, Sheri Jesiel, Tony 
McCombie, Margo McDermed, Charles Meier, David S. Olsen, Nick Sauer, Joe Sosnowski, Ryan Spain, 
Grant Wehrli, Keith R. Wheeler, Lindsay Parkhurst, Mark Batinick, Steven Reick, Chad Hays and Thomas 
M. Bennett 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. In Articles 2, 14, 15, 16, and 17, requires active Tier 1 employees 
to elect either (i) to have automatic annual increases in retirement and survivor's annuities delayed and 
reduced or (ii) to maintain current benefits except for additional limits on pensionable salary; provides 
additional benefits to persons electing item (i). Makes funding changes, including shifting certain costs to 



employers under Articles 15 and 16. Restricts participation in the General Assembly Retirement System 
to persons who became participants before the effective date. In Articles 14, 15, and 16, requires those 
Systems to offer an optional accelerated benefit payment to certain members in lieu of receiving a 
pension. Provides separate benefits for certain persons who become participants under Article 14, 15, or 
16. Requires those retirement systems to establish a defined contribution plan for certain members; in 
Articles 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, and 17, establishes similar benefits if the governing body of the unit of 
local government adopts those benefits. In Article 17, requires the State to contribute $215,200,000 for 
fiscal year 2017. Provides a continuing appropriation for the Article 17 State contribution and for certain 
consideration payments. Amends various Acts to make conforming changes. Provides for the transfer of 
certain amounts to the Pension Stabilization Fund. Amends the Illinois Educational Labor Relations Act 
and the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act to prohibit bargaining and interest arbitration regarding certain 
changes made by the amendatory Act; exempts certain existing agreements. Makes other changes. 
Includes severability provisions. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/3/2018 House Rule 19(a) / Re-referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4030  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-COLLEGE PROMISE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Will Guzzardi, Camille Y. Lilly, William Davis, Theresa Mah, Robyn Gabel and Justin Slaughter 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Higher Education Student Assistance Act. Requires the Illinois Student Assistance 
Commission to implement and administer a program to award College Promise grants to Illinois residents 
seeking an associate degree from a public community college or a bachelor's degree from a public 
university. Provides that a College Promise grant shall be equal to the cost of tuition and mandatory fees 
at the public institution attended less all other student aid, subject to appropriation from the College 
Promise Fund; defines "student aid". Sets forth the terms and conditions of the program. Amends the 
State Finance Act to create the College Promise Fund as a special fund in the State treasury. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  4/5/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4033  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-COMMENCEMENT SPEAKER 



 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Mark Batinick-Reginald Phillips-Jeanne M Ives-Grant Wehrli-Steven A. Andersson and Terri Bryant 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities and public community colleges 
in Illinois. Prohibits a university or community college district from using State-appropriated funds to pay 
an individual to deliver the commencement address at any graduation ceremony conducted by an 
institution, but allows the use of private funds for such purposes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  4/24/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4045  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert Martwick 
 
Senate Sponsors 
(Sen. John J. Cullerton-Don Harmon) 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. In Articles 2, 14, 15, 16, and 17, requires active Tier 1 employees 
to elect either (i) to have automatic annual increases in retirement and survivor's annuities delayed and 
reduced or (ii) to maintain current benefits except for additional limits on pensionable salary; provides 
additional benefits to persons electing item (i). Makes funding changes, including shifting certain costs to 
employers under Articles 15 and 16. Restricts participation in the General Assembly Retirement System 
to persons who became participants before the effective date. In Articles 14, 15, and 16, requires those 
Systems to offer an optional accelerated benefit payment to certain members in lieu of receiving a 
pension. Provides separate benefits for certain persons who become participants under Article 14, 15, or 
16. Requires those retirement systems to establish a defined contribution plan for certain members; in 
Articles 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, and 17, establishes similar benefits if the governing body of the unit of 
local government adopts those benefits. In Article 17, requires the State to contribute $215,200,000 for 
fiscal year 2017. Provides a continuing appropriation for the Article 17 State contribution and for certain 
consideration payments. Amends various Acts to make conforming changes. Provides for the transfer of 
certain amounts to the Pension Stabilization Fund. Amends the Illinois Educational Labor Relations Act 
and the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act to prohibit bargaining and interest arbitration regarding certain 
changes made by the amendatory Act; exempts certain existing agreements. Makes other changes. 
Includes severability provisions. Effective immediately. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 1 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the General Provisions Article of the Illinois 
Pension Code. Provides that the Board of any pension fund or retirement system may authorize active 
Tier 1 employees to elect to have automatic annual increases in retirement and survivor's annuities 
delayed and reduced. Provides that a Tier 1 employee who makes that election is entitled to have 



contributions reduced to a specified rate and to receive a consideration payment of 10% of contributions 
made prior to the election. Provides separate benefits for persons who, on or after July 1, 2018, first 
become participants or members under the State Universities or Downstate Teachers Article or a 
noncovered participant under the State Employees Article. Authorizes persons who first become 
members or participants of those Systems on or after July 1, 2018 to elect the Tier 2 benefits in lieu of 
those separate benefits. Authorizes Tier 2 members to elect those separate benefits in lieu of the Tier 2 
benefits. Requires those retirement systems to establish a voluntary defined contribution plan for certain 
Tier 1 members. In the Chicago Municipal, Cook County, Cook County Forest Preserve, Chicago 
Laborers, Chicago Park District, and Chicago Teachers Articles, establishes similar benefits if the 
governing body of the unit of local government adopts those benefits by resolution or ordinance. In the 
State Employee, State Universities, and Downstate Teachers Articles, authorizes those Systems to 
calculate the net present value of the pension benefits for certain inactive members and to offer those 
members the opportunity to elect to receive an accelerated pension benefit payment equal to 70% of the 
net present value of their pension benefits in lieu of receiving any pension benefit. In the State 
Universities and Downstate Teachers Articles, shifts certain costs to the local employer. Repeals certain 
provisions related to defined contributions plans under Public Act 98-599, which has been declared 
unconstitutional. Amends the State Employees Group Insurance Act of 1971 to make a conforming 
change. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation without reimbursement. Makes other 
changes. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 2 
     Fixes typographical errors. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  8/4/2017 Senate Pursuant to Senate Rule 3-9(b) / Referred to Assignments 

 

 
HB 4055  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Mark Batinick 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. Restricts participation in the General Assembly Retirement System 
to persons who became participants before the effective date. Provides separate benefits for persons 
who, on or after 6 months after the effective date, first become participants or members under Article 15 
or 16 or a noncovered participant under Article 14. Requires those retirement systems to establish a 
defined contribution plan for certain members. For Articles 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, and 17, establishes 
similar benefits if the governing body of the unit of local government adopts those benefits by resolution 
or ordinance. Requires the 5 State-funded Retirement Systems to offer certain inactive members the 
opportunity to elect to receive an accelerated pension benefit payment in lieu of receiving any pension 
benefit and authorizes the issuance of bonds for those payments. Amends other Acts to make conforming 
changes. In the 5 State-funded retirement systems and the Chicago Teachers Pension Fund, makes 
funding changes. In Articles 15 and 16, shifts certain costs to the local employer. Amends the Budget 
Stabilization Act. Provides for the transfer of certain amounts to the Pension Stabilization Fund. Makes 
other changes. Effective immediately. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  5/25/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4057  
 

Short Description:  PENCD-STATE SYS-TIER 3 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jeanne M Ives 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. For the 5 State-funded Retirement Systems: Requires 
implementation of a Tier 3 plan that aggregates State and employee contributions in individual participant 
accounts. Provides that a person who becomes a participant on or after July 1, 2018 shall participate in 
the Tier 3 plan. Authorizes a Tier 1 or Tier 2 participant to elect to participate in the Tier 3 plan. Requires 
Systems to offer an optional accelerated benefit payment to certain members in lieu of receiving a 
pension and authorizes the issuance of bonds for those payments. Authorizes a person to elect not to 
participate or to terminate participation in the Systems. Restricts participation in the General Assembly 
Retirement System to current participants. In Articles 7, 14, 15, and 16, for new participants, prohibits 
unused sick or vacation time from being used to calculate pensionable salary or establish service credit. 
In Articles 15 and 16, requires an employer to pay the projected costs of the increase in pension benefits 
associated with an increase in salary. In Article 16, prohibits an employer from making employee 
contributions on behalf of an employee, except as specified. Amends other Acts to prohibit collective 
bargaining over that prohibition and make conforming changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  5/29/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4060  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-STATE SYS-TIER 3 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Allen Skillicorn 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. With respect to the 5 State-funded Retirement Systems: requires 
each System to implement a Tier 3 plan by July 1, 2018 that aggregates State and employee 



contributions in individual participant accounts which are used for payouts after retirement. Provides that 
a person who becomes a participant of a System on or after July 1, 2018 shall participate in the Tier 3 
plan instead of the defined benefit plan. Authorizes a Tier 1 or Tier 2 participant to elect to participate in 
the Tier 3 plan instead of the defined benefit plan and to also elect to terminate all participation in the 
defined benefit plan and to have a specified amount credited to his or her account. In Articles 14, 15, and 
16, requires those Systems to offer an optional accelerated benefit payment to certain members in lieu of 
receiving a pension; authorizes bonds to be issued for those payments. Repeals provisions relating to the 
defined contribution plan established under Public Act 98-599, which has been held unconstitutional. 
Makes related changes in the State Employees Group Insurance Act of 1971. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  6/21/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4061  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Kelly M. Cassidy 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Prepaid Tuition Act. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning a tax 
exemption. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  6/21/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4064  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the General Assembly, State Employee, State Universities, Downstate Teacher, and 
Chicago Teacher Articles of the Illinois Pension Code. Requires active Tier 1 employees to elect either to 
(i) have automatic annual increases in retirement and survivor's annuities delayed and reduced or (ii) 
maintain their current benefit package with additional limitations on pensionable salary. Provides that a 



Tier 1 employee who elects item (i) is entitled to have future increases in income treated as pensionable 
income, have contributions reduced to a specified rate, and receive a consideration payment of 10% of 
contributions made prior to the election. Provides that a Tier 1 employee who elects item (ii) is not eligible 
to have future increases in income treated as pensionable income. Makes funding changes. Amends the 
State Pension Funds Continuing Appropriation Act to provide a continuing appropriation for the amounts 
of the consideration payments. Amends various Acts to make conforming changes. Amends the Illinois 
Educational Labor Relations Act and the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act to prohibit bargaining and 
interest arbitration regarding certain changes made by the amendatory Act and to provide that no action 
of the employer taken to implement that prohibition shall give rise to an unfair labor practice under those 
Acts; exempts certain existing agreements. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation 
without reimbursement. Makes other changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  6/21/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4065  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. Restricts participation in the General Assembly Retirement System 
to persons who became participants before the effective date. Provides separate benefits for persons 
who, on or after 6 months after the effective date, first become participants or members under the State 
Universities or Downstate Teachers Article or a noncovered participant under the State Employees 
Article. Requires those retirement systems to establish a defined contribution plan for certain members. In 
the Chicago Municipal, Cook County, Cook County Forest Preserve, Chicago Laborers, Chicago Park 
District, and Chicago Teachers Articles, establishes similar benefits if the governing body of the unit of 
local government adopts those benefits by resolution or ordinance. In the State Employee, State 
Universities, and Downstate Teachers Articles, requires those Systems to offer certain inactive members 
the opportunity to elect to receive an accelerated pension benefit payment in lieu of receiving any pension 
benefit. In the 5 State-funded retirement systems and the Chicago Teachers Pension Fund, makes 
funding changes. In the State Universities and Downstate Teachers Articles, shifts certain costs to the 
local employer. In the Chicago Teachers Article, requires the State to contribute the employer normal cost 
of pension benefits for certain employees and provides a continuing appropriation from the Common 
School Fund for those contributions. Amends the Budget Stabilization Act. Provides for the transfer of 
certain amounts from the General Revenue Fund to the Pension Stabilization Fund. Makes other 
changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  6/21/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 4068  
 

Short Description:  WORKERS' COMP-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Freedom of Information Act. Exempts from public inspection certain information collected 
by the Illinois Workers' Compensation Commission from self-insureds and papers, documents, reports, or 
evidence relevant to a workers' compensation fraud investigation conducted by the Department of 
Insurance. Amends the Criminal Code of 2012 regarding workers' compensation fraud penalties. Amends 
the Workers' Compensation Act. Makes changes concerning: when an accidental injury shall not be 
considered to be "arising out of and in the course of employment" if the accidental injury or medical 
condition occurred while the claimant was traveling away from the employer's premises; the maximum 
compensation rate for a period of temporary total incapacity; compensation awards for injuries to the 
shoulder and hip; the maximum allowable payment for certain service categories; the assignment and 
reassignment of arbitrators to hearing sites; the creation of an evidence based drug formulary; annual 
reports on the state of self-insurance for workers' compensation in Illinois; and other matters. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  7/6/2017 House Rule 19(a) / Re-referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4071  
 

Short Description:  WORKERS' COMP-RATE CHANGES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Allen Skillicorn 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Workers' Compensation Act. Changes the compensation rates for certain accidental 
injuries to the levels that existed before Public Act 94-277 took effect. Removes language requiring 
employers to make payments on annual adjustments to the compensation rate in awards for permanent 
total disability for every accident occurring on or after July 20, 2005 but before November 11, 2005 (the 
date Public Act 94-695 took effect). Directs Workers' compensation Medical Fee Advisory Board to 
develop a fee payment schedule for procedures, treatments, and services covered under the Act based 
upon fees for such procedures, treatments, and services authorized under Medicare. Makes other 
changes. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  6/21/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4076  
 

Short Description:  USE/OCC TX-AVIATION FUEL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Luis Arroyo 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Finance Act. Creates the State Aviation Program Fund, the Local Government 
Aviation Trust Fund, and the Aviation Fuel Sales Tax Refund Fund. Provides that moneys in the State 
Aviation Program Fund shall be used by the Department of Transportation for the purposes of 
administering a State Aviation Program. Provides that moneys in the Local Government Aviation Trust 
Fund shall be used by units of local government for airport-related purposes. Provides that moneys in the 
Aviation Fuel Sales Tax Refund Fund shall be used by the Department of Revenue to pay refunds. 
Amends the Use Tax Act, the Service Use Tax Act, the Service Occupation Tax Act, and the Retailers' 
Occupation Tax Act to provide that moneys received from the tax paid on aviation fuel shall be deposited 
into those Funds. Amends the Motor Fuel Tax Law. Provides that aviation fuel sold or used on or after 
December 1, 2017 shall be deposited into the State Aviation Program Fund. Amends the Innovation 
Development and Economy Act, the Counties Code, the Illinois Municipal Code, the Civic Center Code, 
the Flood Prevention District Act, the Metro-East Park and Recreation District Act, the Local Mass Transit 
District Act, the Regional Transportation Authority Act, and the Water Commission Act of 1985. Prohibits 
certain local retailers' occupation taxes on aviation fuel unless the unit of local government has an airport-
related purpose. Provides that the proceeds from those taxes on aviation fuel shall be deposited into the 
Local Government Aviation Trust Fund. Amends the Business Enterprise for Minorities, Females, and 
Persons with Disabilities Act to provide that the term "State contract" specifically includes contracts paid 
from moneys available in the State Aviation Program Fund. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  6/29/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4079  
 

Short Description:  ETHICS-GIFT BAN 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Scott Drury 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Makes the gift ban apply to additional classes 



of persons. Places caps on gifts that may be accepted as exempt under the educational materials and 
missions exemption and the travel expenses for State business exemption. Removes specified 
exemptions to the gift ban. Exempts from the gift ban the cost of food or beverages consumed at certain 
receptions, meals, and meetings. Establishes a procedure for the reporting of all gifts that are accepted 
as exempt from the gift ban. Authorizes the Secretary of State to institute a system for the reporting of 
accepted gifts. Increases penalties for violations of the gift ban. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  8/16/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4087  
 

Short Description:  ABOLISH CONFEDERATE SYMBOL ACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. La Shawn K. Ford-Thaddeus Jones 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Abolition of Confederate Symbols Act. Provides that no public body shall display the 
Battle Flag of the Confederacy, otherwise known as the "Confederate Flag", or any other similar image, 
on any public property or land in the State unless the flag or an image thereof appears in a book, digital 
medium, or museum, or is used to serve any other educational or historical purpose. Provides that no 
public body shall sell the Battle Flag of the Confederacy, or any other object or property containing an 
image of the flag, unless the flag or an image thereof appears in a book, digital medium, or museum, or is 
used to serve any other educational or historical purpose. Provides that no monument, memorial, or 
statue honoring the Confederate States of America or any soldier of the Confederacy shall be erected on 
public property or land in this State, or otherwise be erected using public funds. Provides that any 
monument, memorial, or statue honoring the Confederate States of America or any soldier of the 
Confederacy existing on public property or land as of the effective date of this Act shall be removed within 
a reasonable period of time thereafter. Defines terms. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  10/12/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4093  
 

Short Description:  SANCTUARY CITY SANCTION ACT 

 



House Sponsors 
Rep. C.D. Davidsmeyer-David B. Reis-Terri Bryant-Bill Mitchell 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Sanctuary City Sanction Act. Provides that if a unit of local government has in place any 
policy that limits or restricts compliance with immigration detainers issued by the Secretary of Homeland 
Security or otherwise does not comply with an immigration detainer, all grants of State funds that the unit 
of local government would otherwise receive will not be distributed to the unit of local government until 
any policy that limits or restricts compliance with an immigration detainer is abolished and compliance 
with immigration detainers is demonstrated by the unit of local government. Defines terms. Repeals the 
Illinois TRUST Act. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  10/12/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4096  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-MCO-PREFERRED RX LIST 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Gregory Harris-Juliana Stratton-Mary E. Flowers-Sara Feigenholtz-William Davis, Robyn Gabel, La 
Shawn K. Ford, Jaime M. Andrade, Jr., Kelly M. Cassidy, Cynthia Soto, Rita Mayfield, Laura Fine, 
Kathleen Willis, Elizabeth Hernandez, Michelle Mussman, Thaddeus Jones, Carol Ammons, Camille Y. 
Lilly, Theresa Mah, Sam Yingling, Emanuel Chris Welch and Robert Martwick 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Provides that the Department 
of Healthcare and Family Services shall require each Medicaid Managed Care Organization to list as 
preferred on the Medicaid Managed Care Organization's preferred drug list every pharmaceutical that is 
listed as preferred on the Department's preferred drug list. Provides that the Department shall not prohibit, 
or adopt any rules or policies that prohibit, a Medicaid Managed Care Organization from: (i) covering 
additional pharmaceuticals that are not listed on the Department's preferred drug list; or (ii) removing from 
the Medicaid Managed Care Organization's preferred drug list any prior approval requirements applicable 
under the Department's preferred drug list. Provides that the Department shall not require a Medicaid 
Managed Care Organization to utilize a single, statewide preferred drug list and shall not prohibit a plan 
from negotiating drug pricing concessions or rebates on any drug with pharmaceutical companies, unless 
otherwise required by federal law. Provides that no later than July 1, 2018, the Department shall develop 
a standardized format for all Medicaid Managed Care Organization preferred drug lists in cooperation with 
Medicaid Managed Care Organizations and stakeholders, including, but not limited to, community-based 
organizations, providers, and individuals or entities with expertise in drug formulary development. 
Requires each Medicaid Managed Care Organization to post its preferred drug list on its website without 
restricting access to enrolled members and to update the preferred drug list posted on its website within 2 
business days of making any changes to the preferred drug list, including, but not limited to, any and all 
changes to requirements for prior approval. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 House Placed on Calendar Order of 3rd Reading - Short Debate 

 

 
HB 4100  
 

Short Description:  NURSES-VIOLENCE PREVENTION 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Stephanie A. Kifowit-Keith R. Wheeler, Kathleen Willis and Frances Ann Hurley 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Nurse Practice Act. Defines "retail health care facility". Creates provisions concerning 
workplace violence against nurses in specified medical facilities concerning notice, contacting law 
enforcement, and mental health services. Requires specified medical facilities to create a workplace 
violence prevention program with specified requirements. Provides whistleblower protections for any 
nurse of a specified medical facility if management retaliates against the nurse for certain actions. 
Provides appropriate cross references in the Department of Veterans Affairs Act, the University of Illinois 
Hospital Act, the MC/DD Act, the ID/DD Community Care Act, and the Hospital Licensing Act. Amends 
the Unified Code of Corrections. Provides that Department of Corrections and Department of Juvenile 
Justice institutions or facilities shall provide notice and specified protections when a committed person is 
transferred out of the institution or facility to receive medical care and treatment. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  10/12/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4103  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED CENTERS EXCELLENCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Dan Brady 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Requires the Board of Higher Education to establish a 
uniform admission process online, which must be used at all public institutions of higher education; sets 
forth what components this admission process must include. Requires the Board (i) to ensure that any 
high school student in this State with a 3.0 cumulative grade point average or better on a 4.0 scale (or the 
equivalent on a 5.0 scale) receives access to the opportunity of higher education and (ii) to guarantee 
admission to a public university; requires cooperation by the State Board of Education, high schools, and 
public universities. Requires the Board to conduct a study of the academic programs offered at each 
public university campus. Sets forth the Board's duties concerning the study. Requires the Board to use 
the results of the study and other specified factors to determine which academic programs should be 



prioritized at campuses of public universities and to create and designate Higher Education Strategic 
Centers of Excellence. Requires the Board to work with the Illinois Community College Board to develop 
recommendations to integrate community colleges into this plan. Sets forth additional Board of Higher 
Education duties concerning evaluating programmatic expansions and new programs and studying 
student financial aid and multi-year budgeting. Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public 
universities to make conforming changes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  10/12/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4116  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAL RECORD COPIES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Emanuel Chris Welch 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Code of Civil Procedure. Provides that notwithstanding any other provision of law, a 
health care facility or health care practitioner shall provide a patient's records without charge if the records 
are being requested by the patient for use in supporting an application, claim, or appeal relating to a 
government benefit or program. Provides that if the health care facility or health care practitioner 
maintains records in electronic form, the health care facility or health care practitioner shall provide the 
copy to the patient in either electronic or paper form, as required by the government entity administering 
the benefit or program, or at the request of the patient. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 House Assigned to Insurance: Health & Life Committee 

 

 
HB 4134  
 

Short Description:  ETHICS-SEX HARASSMENT TRAINING 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Litesa E. Wallace-Steven A. Andersson-Ann M. Williams-Kelly M. Cassidy-Will Guzzardi, Jaime M. 
Andrade, Jr., Emanuel Chris Welch, David McSweeney, Sonya M. Harper, Carol Ammons, Elgie R. Sims, 
Jr., Deb Conroy, Al Riley, LaToya Greenwood, Theresa Mah, Melissa Conyears-Ervin, Scott Drury, 
Cynthia Soto, La Shawn K. Ford, Elizabeth Hernandez, David Harris, Rita Mayfield, Barbara Wheeler, 
Anna Moeller, Linda Chapa LaVia, Marcus C. Evans, Jr., Grant Wehrli, Charles Meier, Daniel Swanson, 



Avery Bourne, Norine K. Hammond, Michael P. McAuliffe, Tom Demmer, Ryan Spain, Jerry Lee Long, 
Margo McDermed, Thomas M. Bennett, Tim Butler, Allen Skillicorn, Mark Batinick, Mike Fortner, Sara 
Wojcicki Jimenez, Nick Sauer, Peter Breen and Patricia R. Bellock 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Provides for the implementation of a sexual 
harassment training program to be completed by specified State officials and employees, and to be 
conducted by the appropriate State agency of those State officials and employees. Provides additional 
requirements for operation of the program, and for reporting and completion of sexual harassment 
training under the program. Authorizes the Legislative Ethics Commission to make rulings, issue 
recommendations, and impose administrative fines in connection with findings of sexual harassment. 
Authorizes the Legislative Inspector General to receive and investigate allegations of sexual harassment. 
Requires ethics officers to provide guidance to officers and employees in registering complaints about 
sexual harassment with the Legislative Inspector General. Provides for sexual harassment complaint 
procedures. Amends the Lobbyist Registration Act. Requires the Secretary of State to receive and 
investigate allegations of sexual harassment, and to immediately transmit those allegations to the 
Secretary of State Inspector General. Provides that each natural person required to register as a lobbyist 
under the Act must complete a program of sexual harassment training no later than 30 days after 
registration or renewal of registration under the Act. Defines terms. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  10/24/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4157  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-ATHLETE IS EMPLOYEE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Thaddeus Jones 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities in Illinois. Requires a public 
university to classify as an employee of the university a student who is an athlete of any of the top 3 
financially profitable intercollegiate athletic programs at the university. Provides that the university shall 
pay the student athlete a minimum of $25,000 per academic year, but his or her work hours and work 
schedule are at the discretion of the university. Allows the university to classify as an employee of the 
university a student who is an athlete of any of the other intercollegiate athletic programs at the university, 
with his or her pay, work hours, and work schedule determined by the university. Sets forth provisions 
concerning collegiate and intercollegiate athletic associations and contractual agreements. Effective July 
1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  11/15/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 4158  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-ATHLETE IS EMPLOYEE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Thaddeus Jones 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities in Illinois. Requires a public 
university to classify as an employee of the university a student who is an athlete of any of the top 3 
financially profitable intercollegiate athletic programs at the university. Provides that the university shall 
pay the student athlete a minimum of $25,000 per academic year, but his or her work hours and work 
schedule are at the discretion of the university. Allows the university to classify as an employee of the 
university a student who is an athlete of any of the other intercollegiate athletic programs at the university, 
with his or her pay, work hours, and work schedule determined by the university. Sets forth provisions 
concerning collegiate and intercollegiate athletic associations and contractual agreements. Effective July 
1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  11/15/2017 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4163  
 

Short Description:  EQUAL PAY ACT-WAGE HISTORY 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Anna Moeller-Katie Stuart-Barbara Flynn Currie-Kelly M. Cassidy-La Shawn K. Ford, Stephanie A. 
Kifowit, Martin J. Moylan, Silvana Tabares, Kelly M. Burke, Lawrence Walsh, Jr., Thaddeus Jones, Sue 
Scherer, Michelle Mussman, Sara Feigenholtz, Jonathan Carroll, John Connor, Ann M. Williams, Deb 
Conroy, Sam Yingling, Steven A. Andersson, Elizabeth Hernandez, Luis Arroyo, Fred Crespo, Melissa 
Conyears-Ervin, Linda Chapa LaVia, Christian L. Mitchell, Juliana Stratton, Robyn Gabel, Sonya M. 
Harper, Emanuel Chris Welch, Will Guzzardi, LaToya Greenwood, Kathleen Willis, Litesa E. Wallace, Lou 
Lang, Theresa Mah, Natalie A. Manley, Michael Halpin, Natalie Phelps Finnie, Robert Martwick, Laura 
Fine, Al Riley, Carol Sente, Jaime M. Andrade, Jr., Rita Mayfield, Jay Hoffman, Camille Y. Lilly, Marcus C. 
Evans, Jr., Michael J. Madigan, Carol Ammons, Jerry Costello, II, Gregory Harris, Michael J. Zalewski, 
Frances Ann Hurley, Jehan Gordon-Booth and Arthur Turner 
 
Senate Sponsors 
(Sen. Cristina Castro-Linda Holmes-Thomas Cullerton-Melinda Bush-Toi W. Hutchinson, Kimberly A. 
Lightford, Antonio Muñoz, Heather A. Steans and Laura M. Murphy) 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Equal Pay Act of 2003. Prohibits an employer from: (i) screening job applicants based on 



their wage or salary history, (ii) requiring that an applicant's prior wages satisfy minimum or maximum 
criteria, and (iii) requesting or requiring as a condition of being interviewed or as a condition of continuing 
to be considered for an offer of employment that an applicant disclose prior wages or salary. Prohibits an 
employer from seeking the salary, including benefits or other compensation or salary history, of a job 
applicant from any current or former employer, with some exceptions. Limits defenses. Provides for 
penalties and injunctive relief. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 1 
     Deletes language providing that an employer's wage differential defense does not apply if an 
employee demonstrates that an alternative employment practice exists that would serve the same 
business purpose without producing the differential and the employer has refused to adopt the alternative 
practice. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
HB 4167  
 

Short Description:  SCH CD-SUBSTITUTE TEACHER LIC 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Lindsay Parkhurst 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Educator Licensure Article of the School Code. Allows a student enrolled in an educator 
preparation program at a regionally accredited institution of higher education to apply for a substitute 
teaching license if the student has earned at least 90 credit hours at that institution (rather than requiring 
all applicants to hold a bachelor's degree or higher). Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/7/2018 House To Special Issues Subcommittee 

 

 
HB 4169  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-SEX VIOLENCE TRANSCR 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jonathan Carroll 



Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Preventing Sexual Violence in Higher Education Act. Provides that certain higher 
education institutions shall note any violations of a comprehensive policy on any academic transcripts 
prepared for a student within 5 years following a finding of a violation. Provides that if a student transfers 
to another higher education institution, certain higher education institutions must also note the violation on 
any academic transcripts prepared within the 5 years following a finding of a violation. Limits the 
provisions to public universities and public community colleges. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4174  
 

Short Description:  NOTICE OF DATA BREACH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Barbara Wheeler 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Personal Information Protection Act. Requires any data collector that owns or licenses 
personal information concerning an Illinois resident and any State agency that collects personal 
information concerning an Illinois resident to notify the resident of any security breach of the system data 
within 48 hours of discovery of the breach (rather than requiring notification in the most expedient time 
possible and without unreasonable delay). 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4179  
 

Short Description:  INC TAX CREDIT INTERNS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David B. Reis 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Authorizes a credit to taxpayers for 10% of stipends or salaries 
paid to qualified college interns. Limits the credit to stipends and salaries paid to 5 interns each year, and 
limits total credits to $3,000 for all years combined. Defines a "qualified college intern". Provides that the 



credit may not reduce the taxpayer's liability to less than zero and may not be carried forward or back. 
Exempt from the Act's sunset provisions. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4197  
 

Short Description:  INC TX-INTERNSHIP CREDIT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Thomas M. Bennett 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Creates a credit in an amount equal to 10% of the stipend or 
salary paid by the taxpayer to up to (i) 5 qualified college interns or (ii) 5 qualified high school interns 
during the taxable year. Provides that no taxpayer may claim more than $5,000 in total credits under that 
Section for all taxable years combined. Provides that the credit is exempt from the Act's automatic sunset 
provision. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4215  
 

Short Description:  FINANCE-AVIATION FUND 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Christine Winger 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Finance Act if and only if Senate Bill 482 of the 100th General Assembly becomes 
law as amended by House Amendment 2. Provides that grants from the State Aviation Program Fund to a 
municipality with a population of over 500,000 may be made (i) for the replacement of sound-reducing 
windows and doors installed at an eligible address (instead of installed under the Residential Sound 
Insulation Program); and (ii) for in-home air quality testing at those residences. Effective immediately or 
on the date Senate Bill 482 of the 100th General Assembly takes effect, whichever is later. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  1/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4217  
 

Short Description:  PROCURE CD-CONFLICT DISCLOSURE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David Harris 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that any board, commission, authority, or other entity 
authorized or created by State law with the power to award contracts under the Code shall, as a part of 
the notice required for the awarding of contracts, disclose specified information regarding conflicts of 
interest. Requires that disclosure must be posted in the online electronic Bulletin along with and 
conforming to the notice posted for the awarding of contracts. Requires disclosed conflict of interest 
information to be made available on the electronic Bulletin clearinghouse. Defines "conflict of interest". 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 

 

 
HB 4228  
 

Short Description:  USE/OCC TX-AVIATION FUEL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David Harris-Joe Sosnowski-Mike Fortner and Brian W. Stewart 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Finance Act. Creates the State Aviation Program Fund, the Local Government 
Aviation Trust Fund, and the Aviation Fuel Sales Tax Refund Fund. Provides that moneys in the State 
Aviation Program Fund and the Local Government Aviation Trust Fund shall be used by the Department 
of Transportation for the purposes of administering a State Aviation Program. Provides that the State 
Aviation Program shall include grants to units of local government for airport-related purposes. Provides 
that moneys in the Aviation Fuel Sales Tax Refund Fund shall be used by the Department of Revenue to 
pay refunds. Amends the Use Tax Act, the Service Use Tax Act, the Service Occupation Tax Act, and the 
Retailers' Occupation Tax Act to provide that the local share of moneys received from the tax paid on 
aviation fuel shall be deposited into those Funds. Amends the Motor Fuel Tax Law. Provides that aviation 
fuel sold or used on or after June 23, 2018 shall be deposited into the State Aviation Program Fund. 
Amends the Innovation Development and Economy Act, the Counties Code, the Illinois Municipal Code, 
the Civic Center Code, the Flood Prevention District Act, the Metro-East Park and Recreation District Act, 
the Local Mass Transit District Act, the Regional Transportation Authority Act, and the Water Commission 



Act of 1985. Prohibits certain local retailers' occupation taxes on aviation fuel unless the unit of local 
government has an airport-related purpose. Provides that the proceeds from those taxes on aviation fuel 
shall be deposited into the Local Government Aviation Trust Fund. Amends the Illinois Municipal Code. 
Contains provisions concerning a Residential Sound Insulation Program. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 House To Sales and Other Taxes Subcommittee 

 

 
HB 4242  
 

Short Description:  FOIA-HARASSMENT SETTLMENTS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David McSweeney-Martin J. Moylan-Thomas Morrison-Mark Batinick-Nick Sauer, Carol Ammons, 
Jonathan Carroll, Sue Scherer, John Connor, Katie Stuart, Deb Conroy, Sam Yingling, Monica Bristow, 
Natalie Phelps Finnie, Jerry Costello, II, Grant Wehrli, Al Riley, Emanuel Chris Welch, Tony McCombie, 
David S. Olsen, Allen Skillicorn, Brian W. Stewart, Litesa E. Wallace and Nicholas K Smith 
 
Senate Sponsors 
(Sen. Thomas Cullerton-Melinda Bush) 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Freedom of Information Act. Provides that a unit of local government, school district, 
community college district, or other local taxing body shall provide notice to the public if the unit of local 
government, school district, community college district, or other local taxing body enters into a severance 
agreement with an employee or contractor accused of sexual harassment or sexual discrimination. 
Provides that no more than 72 hours after the unit of local government, school district, community college 
district, or other local taxing body makes a payment under the severance agreement, the unit of local 
government, school district, community college district, or other local taxing body shall publish on its 
Internet website and cause to be published, for a period of not less than 7 days, in the newspaper of 
general circulation having the largest circulation within the jurisdiction of the unit of local government, 
school district, community college district, or other local taxing body the following information: (1) the 
name of the person receiving the payment; (2) the amount of the payment; and (3) the fact that the 
person receiving the payment has been accused of sexual harassment or sexual discrimination, as the 
case may be. Effective immediately. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 2 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the Local Records Act. Provides that when a 
unit of local government, school district, community college district, or other local taxing body enters a 
severance agreement with an employee or contractor because the employee or contractor was found to 
have engaged in sexual harassment or sexual discrimination, the public body shall publish specified 
information on its Internet website, if one is maintained, and make available such information to the news 
media for inspection and copying within 72 hours of the taxing body's approval of the severance 
agreement. Provides exceptions to disclosure of specified information. Provides that no unit of local 
government, school district, community college district, or other local taxing body shall incur liability as a 
result of its compliance with required disclosures, except for willful or wanton misconduct. Provides that 
disclosure requirements do not supersede the confidentiality provisions of a severance agreement. 



Provides that nothing in the applicable provisions shall limit disclosure of public records required to be 
disclosed under the Act or the Freedom of Information Act. Defines terms. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/9/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
HB 4245  
 

Short Description:  OEIG-DUTIES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David McSweeney-Allen Skillicorn 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Requires the Executive Inspectors General 
appointed under the Act to establish and maintain an Internet website to which all residents of Illinois shall 
have free access, including a prominent statement of notification to the public. Requires the Executive 
Inspectors General appointed under the Act to immediately disclose all detailed findings resulting from 
investigations entered into under Act, and to post those findings on their respective Internet websites. 
Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4261  
 

Short Description:  EXECUTIVE-NONESSENTIAL EXPENSE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Brad Halbrook 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Budget Law. Provides that for the fiscal years ending June 30, 2019, June 30, 
2020, and June 30, 2021, no State funded agency, board, commission, department, university, or other 
entity organized within State government shall expend any funds on specified nonessential items and 
travel. Defines "nonessential items" and "nonessential travel". Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 House Assigned to Executive Committee 

 

 
HB 4263  
 

Short Description:  NURSE LICENSURE COMPACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David B. Reis, Ryan Spain and Christine Winger 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Nurse Practice Act. Ratifies and approves the Nurse Licensure Compact, which allows 
for the issuance of multistate licenses that allow nurses to practice in their home state and other compact 
states. Provides that the Compact does not supersede existing State labor laws. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/5/2018 House Assigned to Executive Committee 

 

 
HB 4266  
 

Short Description:  IMPLEMENT LEGISLATION REPORT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Mary E. Flowers 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Implementation of Legislation Reporting Act. Provides that any State agency required to 
provide benefits or services under the provisions of a covered Public Act shall prepare an Implementation 
Report relating to that covered Public Act, and file the Report with the General Assembly. Requires the 
Implementation Report to also be published on the General Assembly's Internet website. Defines terms. 
Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/19/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 



 
HB 4267  
 

Short Description:  DEPARTMENT IMPLEMENTING REPORT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Mary E. Flowers 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Departments of State Government Law. Provides that each department of State 
government tasked with the implementation of all or any part of a law passed by the General Assembly 
shall be required to prepare and deliver a report to the General Assembly concerning its required 
implementation. Provides for the contents of the report. Provides for the filing of the report with the 
General Assembly. Requires the implementation reports to be made available on the Internet websites of 
the reporting department and the General Assembly. Provides that the implementation reporting 
requirement applies only to laws passed after the effective date of this amendatory Act. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/19/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4323  
 

Short Description:  USE/OCC TX-AVIATION FUEL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Joe Sosnowski 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Finance Act. Creates the State Aviation Program Fund, the Local Government 
Aviation Trust Fund, and the Aviation Fuel Sales Tax Refund Fund. Provides that moneys in the State 
Aviation Program Fund shall be used by the Department of Transportation for the purposes of 
administering a State Aviation Program. Provides that the State Aviation Program shall include grants to 
units of local government for airport-related purposes, including noise mitigation and in-home air quality 
testing. Provides that moneys in the Local Government Aviation Trust Fund shall be used by units of local 
government for airport-related purposes. Provides that moneys in the Aviation Fuel Sales Tax Refund 
Fund shall be used to pay refunds. Amends the Use Tax Act, the Service Use Tax Act, the Service 
Occupation Tax Act, and the Retailers' Occupation Tax Act to provide that the local share of moneys 
received from the tax paid on aviation fuel shall be deposited into those Funds. Amends the Motor Fuel 
Tax Law. Provides that proceeds from taxes on aviation fuel sold or used on or after December 1, 2017 
shall be deposited into the State Aviation Program Fund. Amends various Acts to prohibit certain local 
retailers' occupation taxes on aviation fuel unless the unit of local government has an airport-related 
purpose. Provides that the proceeds from those taxes on aviation fuel shall be deposited into the Local 
Government Aviation Trust Fund. Amends the Illinois Municipal Code. Requires municipalities that have 
implemented a Residential Sound Insulation Program to perform an in-home air quality test if certain 
conditions are met. Effective immediately. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/26/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4331  
 

Short Description:  OPIOID OVERDOSE REPORTING 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. John Connor 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Counties Code. Provides that in every case in which an opioid overdose is determined to 
be a contributing factor in a death, the coroner shall report the death and the age, gender, race, and 
county of residence, if known, of the decedent to the Department of Public Health. Amends the University 
of Illinois Hospital Act and the Hospital Licensing Act. Requires every hospital to report the age, gender, 
race, and county of residence, if known, of each patient diagnosed as having an opioid overdose to the 
Department within 48 hours of the diagnosis. Amends the Department of Public Health Powers and 
Duties Law of the Civil Administrative Code of Illinois. Requires the Department to adopt rules to 
implement the reporting requirements. Requires the Department to annually report to the General 
Assembly the data collected. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 

 

 
HB 4346  
 

Short Description:  SCH CD/HIGHER ED-BLACK HISTORY 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Thaddeus Jones 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the School Code and various Acts relating to the governance of public universities and 
community colleges in Illinois. With respect to the requirement that the events of Black History be taught 
in every public elementary school and high school, provides that a student may not complete the 8th 
grade or graduate from high school without studying this material and that a school may meet this 
requirement through an online program or course. Requires every public institution of higher education 
and community college to offer a course studying the events of Black History. Allows public institutions of 



higher education and community colleges to meet the requirement by offering an online course. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/26/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4371  
 

Short Description:  BONDS-PENSION OBLIGATION 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert Martwick 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the General Obligation Bond Act. Authorizes the issuance of an additional $107,420,000,000 
in State Serial Long Term Pension Obligation Bonds. Amends the State Pension Funds Continuing 
Appropriation Act to create a continuing appropriation for payments on those Bonds. Amends the State 
Finance Act to create the State Pension Serial Long Term Obligation Bond Fund. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4419  
 

Short Description:  EMPLOYMENT RELATIONS ACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Allen Skillicorn 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Employment Relations Act. Provides that employees may: (a) organize together or form, 
join, or assist in labor organization; (b) engage in lawful concerted activities for the purpose of collective 
negotiation or bargaining or other mutual aid and protection; (c) negotiate or bargain collectively with their 
employers through representatives of their own free choice; or (d) refrain from any or all of the activities 
identified in items (a) through (c). Provides that an individual shall not be required as a condition of 
obtaining or continuing employment to: (1) refrain or resign from membership in, voluntary affiliation with, 
or voluntary financial support of a labor organization; (2) become or remain a member of a labor 
organization; (3) pay any dues, fees, assessments, or other charges or expenses to a labor organization; 
or (4) pay to any charitable organization or third party an amount that is in lieu of, equivalent to, or any 
portion of charges or expenses required of members of or employees represented by a labor 



organization. Makes unlawful and unenforceable any agreement or contract between an employer and 
labor organization that requires an employee to satisfy any activities identified in items (1) through (4). 
Contains provisions concerning civil penalties and other matters. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/31/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4421  
 

Short Description:  E-VERIFY REQUIRE EMPLOYER 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David B. Reis-Bill Mitchell-C.D. Davidsmeyer 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Right to Privacy in the Workplace Act. Requires every employer, after hiring an 
employee, to verify the employment eligibility of the employee through the E-Verify program. Provides 
that, in addition to any other requirement for an employer to receive a grant, loan, or performance-based 
incentive from any government entity, the employer shall register with and participate in the E-Verify 
program. Provides that before receiving the economic development incentive, the employer shall provide 
proof to the government entity that the employer is registered with and is participating in the E-Verify 
program. Provides that the State, its political subdivisions, and units of local government, including home 
rule units, shall require each employer to use an Employment Eligibility Verification System as a condition 
of receiving a government contract or a business license. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/31/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4467  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-POLICE/FIRE GRANT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Frances Ann Hurley 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Higher Education Student Assistance Act. In a Section concerning a police officer or fire 
officer survivor grant, provides that, with respect to disabled police and fire officers, natural children need 
not be born before the disability occurred in order to receive the grant. Effective immediately. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/31/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4480  
 

Short Description:  MOTOR FUEL-AVIATION FUEL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. John M. Cabello 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Motor Fuel Tax Law. Provides that the tax shall not be imposed upon the importation or 
receipt of aviation fuels and kerosene at the Chicago Rockford International Airport. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/2/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4495  
 

Short Description:  VOCATIONAL OPPORTUNITY ACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. André Thapedi-Joe Sosnowski, Emanuel Chris Welch and Marcus C. Evans, Jr. 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Vocational Academy Opportunity Act. Creates 2 vocational academies, one located in 
Cook County and the other in St. Clair County, which shall be residential institutions. Provides that each 
academy shall be a State agency, funded by State appropriations, private contributions, and 
endowments. Provides that the academies shall be governed by a single Board of Trustees for the 
collective operation and oversight of the academies. Provides for the membership of the Board. Specifies 
the duties and powers of the Board. Provides that each academy shall be empowered to lease or 
purchase real and personal property on commercially reasonable terms for the use by the academy. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 



 

 
HB 4503  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-IN-STATE STUDENT AID 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Elizabeth Hernandez 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities in Illinois and the Higher 
Education Student Assistance Act. Provides that notwithstanding any other provision of law to the 
contrary, a student who meets the requirements concerning being deemed an Illinois resident for tuition 
purposes is eligible to apply or receive consideration for any student aid or benefit funded or administered 
by the State, State agencies, public institutions, or the university, including scholarships, grants, awards, 
stipends, room and board, tuition waivers, or other financial or in-kind assistance, but excluding Monetary 
Award Program grants. Prohibits each university and the Illinois Student Assistance Commission from 
denying a scholarship, grant, or loan to a person who has been convicted of illegal possession or sale of 
cannabis, controlled substances, or methamphetamine if he or she otherwise qualifies for the scholarship, 
grant, or loan. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/2/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4513  
 

Short Description:  PRO CD-CONSTRUCT MAN-HOURS REQ 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Melissa Conyears-Ervin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that for any project under a construction contract, 
the contract shall require that, to the extent practicable, at least 10% of man-hours performing 
construction services be performed by individuals who reside in areas of poverty. Requires the 
Department of Central Management Services to annually release a list of areas of poverty that meet the 
requirements. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/2/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 4550  
 

Short Description:  PROCUREMENT-CLINICAL SERVICES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Arthur Turner 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that any lease for real property to be used by the 
University of Illinois at Chicago for clinical services and ambulatory surgical services may exceed 10 
years in length, but may not exceed 30 years in length, provided (i) the lease requires the lessor to make 
capital improvements in excess of $100,000 and (ii) the Board of Trustees of the University of Illinois 
determines a term of more than 10 years is necessary and is in the best interest of the public institution of 
higher education. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/5/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4558  
 

Short Description:  ENVIRONMENTAL BARRIERS-STAIRS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Margo McDermed 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Environmental Barriers Act. Provides that a public facility or multi-story housing shall 
have a detectable warning at the bottom step and top step of each stair run. Exempts stairs in dwelling 
units, stairs in enclosed stair towers, and stairs set to the side of the path of travel. Defines "detectable 
warning". 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Assigned to Special Needs Services 

 

 



HB 4583  
 

Short Description:  OPEN MEETINGS-SPECIAL MEETINGS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Brad Halbrook 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Open Meetings Act. Provides that certain notice provisions that currently apply to regular 
meetings of a public body shall also apply to special meetings of a public body. Requires a public body 
that has a website maintained by a full-time staff to post the agenda and notice of meetings for both the 
governing body and all subsidiary bodies of the public body. Removes a provision stating that the failure 
of a public body to post on its website notice of any meeting or the agenda of any meeting shall not 
invalidate any meeting or any actions taken at a meeting. Requires a public body that has a website to 
post the minutes of a regular, special, or emergency meeting of its governing body (currently, only regular 
meeting). Allows a court to declare null and void any final action taken at a meeting in violation of the Act, 
regardless of whether or not the meeting was a closed meeting. Provides that a court shall (rather than 
may) assess against any party, except a State's Attorney, reasonable attorney's fees and other litigation 
costs reasonably incurred by any other party who substantially prevails in any action brought under 
specified provisions of the Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to State Government Administration Committee 

 

 
HB 4684  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-SURS-EMPLOYER CONTRIB 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert Martwick 
 
Senate Sponsors 
(Sen. Omar Aquino) 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Universities Article of the Illinois Pension Code. Provides that if an employer fails to 
transmit required contributions to the System for more than 120 days after the payment of those 
contributions is due, the Board may certify to the State Comptroller the amount of those delinquent 
employer contributions and the State Comptroller shall deduct the certified amount from State funds to 
the employer and remit the amount deducted to the System. Provides that if State funds from which those 
deductions may be made are not available or if deductions are delayed for longer than 120 days after the 
date of the certification to the Comptroller, the Board may proceed against the employer to recover the 
amounts of such delinquent payments in the appropriate circuit court. Adds similar provisions if the 
employer is a community college district. Makes other changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  3/9/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
HB 4710  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-CREDITCARD MARKETING 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Sue Scherer-La Shawn K. Ford-Stephanie A. Kifowit-Christine Winger-Jaime M. Andrade, Jr., 
Monica Bristow, Martin J. Moylan, Linda Chapa LaVia and Juliana Stratton 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities and community colleges in 
Illinois. Provides that the Board of Trustees of a public university or community college district in this State 
may not enter into an agreement or allow any person or group affiliated with the university or district to 
enter into an agreement with a credit card issuer to allow the credit card issuer to market credit cards to 
students. Defines terms. Repeals the Credit Card Marketing Act of 2009. Makes conforming changes in 
the Freedom of Information Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Standard Debate 

 

 
HB 4736  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAL FRAGILE TECH DEPENDENT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Fred Crespo 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Provides that notwithstanding 
any other provision of law, the Department of Healthcare and Family Services shall not require children 
made eligible for medical assistance through any home and community-based services waiver program 
for medically fragile and technology dependent children authorized under the Social Security Act to enroll 
in or transition to the State's managed care medical assistance program. Provides that any medically 
fragile and technology dependent child who is enrolled in the State's managed care medical assistance 
program on or before the effective date of the amendatory Act shall be given the option to disenroll from 
the State's managed care medical assistance program and receive medical assistance coverage under 
the State's traditional fee-for-service program. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Appropriations-Human Services Committee 

 

 
HB 4779  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-AUTISM-SOCIAL THERAPY 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Avery Bourne 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Requires the Department of 
Healthcare and Family Services to provide coverage for applied behavior analysis and other social 
therapies for children with autism who otherwise qualify for medical assistance. Requires the Department 
to establish, by rule, treatment criteria and reimbursement methodologies for the covered services. 
Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/13/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4781  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-VETERANS SERVICE ACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Kelly M. Burke 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Higher Education Veterans Service Act. Requires a public college or university to use its 
best efforts to hire a veteran of the armed services as the Coordinator of Veterans and Military Personnel 
Student Services. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 

 



 
HB 4824  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-PARTICIPATION CERT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Norine K. Hammond-Robert W. Pritchard 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State University Certificates of Participation Act. Sets forth the maximum annual debt 
service amount for a State university's total outstanding (instead of total) certificate of participation 
obligation. Provides that the Act applies until December 31, 2028 (instead of December 31, 2014); makes 
a related change. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4834  
 

Short Description:  VEH CD-COLLEGE POLICE PLATE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jeanne M Ives 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Vehicle Code. Beginning with the 2020 registration year, allows vehicles owned or 
operated by or for a private or public university police department or a private or public college police 
department to be registered for a one-time fee of $8.00. Requires registration plates for vehicles owned or 
operated by or for a private or public university police department or a private or public college police 
department to contain the designation "university police" or "college police" and to be numbered and 
distributed as prescribed by the Secretary of State. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4839  
 

Short Description:  PENCD-STATE SYS-TIER 3 



 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jeanne M Ives 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. For the 5 State-funded Retirement Systems: Requires 
implementation of a Tier 3 plan that aggregates State and employee contributions in individual participant 
accounts. Provides that a person who becomes a participant on or after July 1, 2019 shall participate in 
the Tier 3 plan. Authorizes a Tier 1 or Tier 2 participant to elect to participate in the Tier 3 plan. Repeals 
provisions relating to a hybrid benefit plan and makes related changes. Requires Systems to offer an 
optional accelerated benefit payment to certain members in lieu of receiving a pension and authorizes the 
issuance of bonds for those payments. Authorizes a person to elect not to participate or to terminate 
participation in the Systems. Restricts participation in the General Assembly Retirement System to current 
participants. In Articles 7, 14, 15, and 16, for new participants, prohibits unused sick or vacation time from 
being used to calculate pensionable salary or establish service credit. In Articles 15 and 16, requires an 
employer to pay the projected costs of the increase in pension benefits associated with an increase in 
salary. In Article 16, prohibits an employer from making employee contributions on behalf of an employee, 
except as specified. Amends other Acts to prohibit collective bargaining over that prohibition and make 
conforming changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4840  
 

Short Description:  ETHICS-RIGHTS OF COMPLAINANTS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jeanne M Ives, Barbara Wheeler, Sheri Jesiel, Margo McDermed, Rita Mayfield, Linda Chapa 
LaVia, Peter Breen, Mark Batinick, Reginald Phillips, Brad Halbrook, Mike Fortner, Allen Skillicorn, Randy 
E. Frese, John M. Cabello, Jerry Lee Long and Tim Butler 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Provides for specified rights of complainants 
under the Act. Defines terms. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 



HB 4841  
 

Short Description:  LABOR AGREEMENT HEARINGS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jeanne M Ives 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act and the Illinois Educational Labor Relations Act. 
Provides that, once an agreement is reached between a public or educational employer and its 
employees regarding all of the terms of a collective bargaining agreement, the agreement shall be 
reduced to writing and published on the website of the public or educational employer. Requires the 
public or educational employer, not less than 14 days after publishing such an agreement, to hold an 
open public meeting on the ratification of that agreement. Provides that any contract between a public 
employer and an employee where the total compensation exceeds $150,000 shall be published on the 
employer's website for a period of not less than 14 days prior to being signed by both the employer and 
the employee. Requires the public employer to hold an open public meeting on the contract in addition to 
posting it for 14 days if that contract is subject to board approval. Makes conforming changes in the Open 
Meetings Act and the Freedom of Information Act. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4859  
 

Short Description:  GROW STEM TEACHERS ACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert W. Pritchard 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Grow Your Own STEM and Vocational Education Teachers Act. Requires a public 
university to waive any tuition, fees, and on-campus housing costs of a student who agrees to pursue a 
minimum of a bachelor's degree in science, technology, engineering, or mathematics for a teaching 
occupation that includes, but is not limited to, mathematics, natural sciences, or career and vocational 
education in the areas of technology teacher, industrial arts teacher, trade teacher, health care teacher, 
or information technology teacher and maintains a 3.0 cumulative grade point average. Provides that the 
student shall agree to fully reimburse the public university if the student fails to teach at least 3 years at 
an Illinois high school or at least 5 years at an Illinois public institution of higher education. Provides for 
funding. Requires the Board of Higher Education to adopt rules it determines are necessary for the 
administration of the Act. Effective July 1, 2020. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 



  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Appropriations-Higher Education Committee 

 

 
HB 4894  
 

Short Description:  UNIVERSITY-SURPLUS REAL ESTATE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jay Hoffman-Katie Stuart 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Property Control Act. Provides that the Board of Trustees of any public institution of 
higher education in this State is authorized to dispose of surplus real estate of that public institution of 
higher education. Specifies the manner in which a Board of Trustees may dispose of surplus real estate. 
Provides that a Board of Trustees may retain the proceeds from the sale, lease, or other transfer of all or 
any part of the real estate deemed surplus real estate in a separate account in the treasury of the 
institution for the purpose of deferred maintenance and emergency repair of institution property. Requires 
the Auditor General to examine the separate account to ensure the use or deposit of the proceeds in a 
manner consistent with the stated purpose. Defines "public institution of higher education". Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 4914  
 

Short Description:  PROP TX-SCHOOLS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert W. Pritchard-David S. Olsen 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Property Tax Code. Provides that school-approved nonprofit dormitory or residence halls 
occupied in whole or in part by students who belong to fraternities, sororities, or other campus 
organizations are exempt. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Revenue & Finance Committee 



 

 
HB 4956  
 

Short Description:  SCH CD-TEACHERS-3-YEAR DEGREE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. John Cavaletto 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Educator Licensure Article of the School Code. Provides that, beginning with the 2019-
2020 academic year, every public university in this State that offers an educator preparation program 
must offer to those students enrolled in the educator preparation program a 3-year degree completion 
program. Provides that prior to implementation of the program, a public university shall submit to the 
Board of Higher Education the curriculum and requirements of its program for approval. Provides that 
upon completion of the program, a student shall receive a bachelor's degree and qualify for entitlement 
for licensure. Requires the Board of Higher Education, in consultation with the State Educator Preparation 
and Licensure Board and the State Board of Education, to adopt rules to implement the program. 
Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Elementary & Secondary Education: Licensing, 
Administration & Oversight 

 

 
HB 4991  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-PERFORMANCE METRICS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Fred Crespo 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Provides that beginning in Fiscal Year 2019, allocations 
to public universities based upon performance metrics shall not amount to less than 5% of the overall 
higher education budget amount for public universities from the General Revenue Fund. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 



 
HB 5020  
 

Short Description:  HGHER ED-DIVERSE FACULTY GRANT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Dan Brady 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Diversifying Higher Education Faculty in Illinois Act. Provides that the Program Board 
created to administer the grant program authorized by the Act shall be comprised of 11 (rather than 21) 
members. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 

 

 
HB 5021  
 

Short Description:  IBHE-PUBLIC COLLEGE-CLOSING 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert W. Pritchard 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Provides that when a public institution of higher 
education proposes to discontinue operations, it shall file with the Board the original or legible true copies 
of all academic records of the institution. Provides for the specific contents of the records required to be 
filed. Provides that where it appears to the Board that any such records are in danger of being lost, 
hidden, destroyed, or otherwise made unavailable to the Board, the Board may seize and take 
possession of the records, on its own motion and without order of a court. Requires the Board to maintain 
a permanent file of all such records coming into its possession. Provides that, as an alternative to the 
deposit of records with the Board, the public institution of higher education may propose a different 
means for permanent retention of the records, subject to the approval of the Board. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Higher Education Committee 

 

 



HB 5066  
 

Short Description:  IDOT/DNR: LAND TRANSFER 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Avery Bourne-Tim Butler-Natalie Phelps Finnie 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Authorizes the Department of Natural Resources to make certain real estate conveyances in Bureau 
County, Menard County, and Pulaski County, subject to specified conditions. Authorizes the Department 
of Transportation to make certain real estate conveyances in Grundy County, DuPage County, DeKalb 
County, Montgomery County, Tazewell County, and Mason County, subject to specified conditions. 
Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5067  
 

Short Description:  HIGHR ED-RELIGIOUS INSTITUTION 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Nick Sauer 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Private Business and Vocational Schools Act of 2012, the Private College Act, and the 
Academic Degree Act. Defines "religious institution" in these Acts. Provides that any religious institution 
(instead of any institution devoted entirely to the teaching of religion or theology) shall not be considered 
to be a private business and vocational school; makes related changes. Provides that no religious 
institution shall be subject to the educational requirements, standards, or demands contained in the 
Private College Act or the Academic Degree Act or in those Acts' administrative rules, and requires a 
religious institution to notify each of its students in writing that the religious degree being earned or course 
work earned at a religious, non-accredited, post-secondary educational institution may not transfer to 
other institutions. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/7/2018 House Assigned to Higher Education Committee 

 

 



HB 5070  
 

Short Description:  TELEHEALTH-DEFINITION 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Patricia R. Bellock 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Telehealth Act. Includes clinicians licensed to provide medical services under Illinois law 
in the definition of "health care professional". 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 

 

 
HB 5100  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-DENTAL ENCOUNTER 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Elizabeth Hernandez 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Provides that notwithstanding 
any other law to the contrary, the Department of Healthcare and Family Services shall not adopt any rule 
or enter into any contract that prohibits reimbursement under the medical assistance program to an 
eligible clinic for a dental encounter for services performed by an individual licensed to practice dentistry 
or dental hygiene under the Illinois Dental Practice Act. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5111  
 

Short Description:  BEHAVIORAL HLTH WORKFORCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Lou Lang-Deb Conroy, Laura Fine, Natalie A. Manley, Stephanie A. Kifowit, Sara Feigenholtz and 
Michelle Mussman 



Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Behavioral Health Workforce Act. Creates the Behavioral Health Education Center, 
administered by a teaching or research State university, or both. Provides that the Center shall be 
operational on or before July 1, 2019. Provides that the Center shall: (1) provide funds for 2 additional 
medical residents in a State-based psychiatry program each year beginning July 1, 2019 until a total of 8 
additional psychiatry residents are added in 2022; (2) provide funds for 5 one-year doctoral-level 
psychology internships, master social workers, and master level clinical professional counselors in this 
State within 12 months after the effective date of this Act and every year thereafter and increase the 
number of interns in the program to 10 within 36 months after the effective date of this Act. Provides that 
the interns shall be placed in communities so as to increase access to behavioral health services for 
patients residing in rural and underserved areas of this State; and (3) beginning July 1, 2020, develop 5 
behavioral health interdisciplinary training sites each year until a total of 20 sites have been developed. 
Provides that 10 of the 20 sites shall be in counties with a population of fewer than 50,000 inhabitants. 
Requires the Center to perform other duties. Provides that no later than December 1 of every odd-
numbered year, the Center shall prepare a report of its activities under the Behavioral Health Workforce 
Act. Provides that the report shall be filed electronically with the General Assembly and shall be provided 
electronically to any member of the General Assembly upon request. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House Placed on Calendar 2nd Reading - Short Debate 

 

 
HB 5114  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-DNST POL & SURS-TIER 2 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Chad Hays 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Downstate Police and State Universities Articles of the Illinois Pension Code. In the 
Downstate Police Article, provides that a police officer who previously participated in the Illinois Municipal 
Retirement Fund (IMRF) for service as a member of the police department of a municipality and was 
transferred to that municipality's police pension fund upon its creation under the Downstate Police Article 
shall, for the purposes of determining the applicable tier of benefits under that Article, be deemed to have 
become a police officer and member of that municipality's police pension fund on the date that he or she 
first participated in IMRF as a member of the police department of that municipality, notwithstanding 
whether that start date was before January 1, 2011. In the State Universities Article, provides that a Tier 2 
member who has at least 20 years of service in the System as a police officer or firefighter is entitled to a 
retirement annuity on or after the attainment of age 60, if a specified rule applies to that participant. 
Makes a conforming change. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation without 
reimbursement. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 5122  
 

Short Description:  DCFS-TUITION & FEE WAIVERS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Emanuel Chris Welch-Steven A. Andersson, Lou Lang, Theresa Mah, Robert Martwick, Jaime M. 
Andrade, Jr., Kelly M. Cassidy, Ann M. Williams, Christian L. Mitchell, Robyn Gabel and Laura Fine 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Children and Family Services Act. Makes post-secondary education tuition and fee 
waivers available to youth for whom the Department of Children and Family Services has court-ordered 
legal responsibility, youth who aged out of care at age 18 or older, or youth formerly under care who have 
been adopted and were the subject of an adoption assistance agreement or who have been placed in 
private guardianship and were the subject of a subsidized guardianship agreement. Requires applicants 
to have earned a high school diploma from an accredited institution or a high school equivalency 
certificate or have met the State criteria for high school graduation before the start of the school year for 
which they are applying for the waivers. Limits the tuition and fee waivers to persons under the age of 26 
and provides that waivers shall be available to a student for at least the first 5 years the student is 
enrolled in a community college, university, or college maintained by the State. Provides that the age 
requirement and 5-year cap on tuition and fee waivers shall be waived and eligibility extended for 
applicants or students who were unable to enroll in a qualifying post-secondary school or complete an 
academic term because the student: (i) was called into active duty with the United States Armed Forces; 
(ii) was deployed for service in the United States Public Health Service Commissioned Corps; or (iii) 
volunteered in the Peace Corps or the AmeriCorps. Permits the Department to provide the student with a 
stipend to cover maintenance and school expenses during the academic years to supplement the 
student's earnings. Requires the Department to develop outreach programs to ensure qualifying youths 
are aware of the availability of the tuition and fee waivers. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 House Assigned to Appropriations-Higher Education Committee 

 

 
HB 5133  
 

Short Description:  INC TX-APPRENTICESHIP 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Michael J. Zalewski, Katie Stuart, John Connor and Sam Yingling 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Creates an income tax credit for qualified education expenses 
incurred by employers on behalf of qualifying apprentices. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Revenue & Finance Committee 

 

 
HB 5138  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-SURS & TRS-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert Martwick 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Pension Code. In provisions of the State Universities and Downstate Teacher 
Articles that require a participant's employer to make an additional contribution if the participant's salary 
exceeds the amount of salary set for the Governor, removes a provision that specifies that the salary of 
the participant is determined on a full-time equivalent basis. In the Downstate Teacher Article, provides 
that for the purpose of calculating a refund under the Article, "accumulated contributions" does not include 
any contributions greater than those actually received by the System. Provides that any person (rather 
than any person, member, trustee, or employee of the Board) who knowingly makes any false statement 
or falsifies or permits to be falsified any record of the System in an attempt to defraud the System, any 
other retirement system or pension fund created under the Code, or the Illinois State Board of Investment 
(rather than the System) is guilty of a Class 3 felony (rather than a Class A misdemeanor). Provides that 
the violation shall be deemed to be relating to the person's service as a teacher for the purpose of the 
felony forfeiture provisions of the Article. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5156  
 

Short Description:  PODIATRIC PHYSICIAN-AGREEMENT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Sara Feigenholtz 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Nurse Practice Act. In provisions concerning written collaborative agreements, restores 
the ability of podiatric physicians to collaborate with advanced practice registered nurses. Makes other 
changes. Effective immediately. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5204  
 

Short Description:  SCH CD-COLLEGE APP REQUIRED 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Nicholas K Smith 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the School Code. Provides that, beginning with the 2019-2020 school year, each school 
district that maintains grades 9 through 12 shall require each student in grade 11 to file an application for 
admission to a public or private college, university, trade or vocational school, or internship or 
apprenticeship program or for entry into military service as a prerequisite to receiving a high school 
diploma; defines "military service". 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5222  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Kathleen Willis 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning 
budget proposals. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 5223  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Kathleen Willis 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Public University Energy Conservation Act. Makes a technical change in a Section 
concerning definitions. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5248  
 

Short Description:  LOTTERY-AUTISM 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Dan Brady 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Lottery Law. Requires the Department of the Lottery, beginning on January 1, 
2019 or as soon thereafter as is practical, to offer a special instant scratch-off game for the benefit of 
research pertaining to autism. Requires the net revenue from that game to be deposited into the Autism 
Research Checkoff Fund. Authorizes the Department to adopt rules necessary to implement and 
administer the game. Amends the Department of Human Services Act. Includes moneys from the special 
instant scratch-off game to be deposited in the Autism Research Checkoff Fund. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/8/2018 House To Finance Subcommittee 

 

 
HB 5285  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-PSYCHIATRIC PAYMENTS 



 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Sara Feigenholtz 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Prompt Payment Act. Provides that after the effective date of the amendatory Act, 
any bill approved for payment under the Act and pursuant to a health benefit plan under the State 
Employees Group Insurance Act of 1971 or submitted under Article V of the Illinois Public Aid Code, 
except a bill for pharmacy or nursing facility services or goods, must be paid or the payment issued to the 
payee in a timely manner. Provides that if payment is not issued to the payee in a timely manner, the 
following interest penalty shall apply to any amount approved and unpaid until final payment is made: the 
sum of the prime commercial rate plus 4.0% per year, applied pro rata for the amount of time the bill 
remains unpaid. Defines "prime commercial rate". Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois 
Public Aid Code. Provides that on and after January 1, 2019, psychiatrists approved by the Department of 
Healthcare and Family Services shall be reimbursed for psychiatric services at a rate that is no lower than 
95% of the Medicare program's rates for specified codes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 House Assigned to Appropriations-Human Services Committee 

 

 
HB 5309  
 

Short Description:  STATE AGENCY BONUS PROHIBITION 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Camille Y. Lilly 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the State Agency and Grantee Bonus Prohibition Act. Provides that no State agency may pay 
a bonus to its employees. Provides that no entity receiving State grant funds may pay a bonus from grant 
funds awarded for operational expenses to its employees. Defines terms. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5339  
 

Short Description:  $UNIVERSITY OF ILLINOIS 

 



House Sponsors 
Rep. Carol Ammons 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Appropriates specified amounts to the Board of Trustees of the University of Illinois from various 
funds. Effective July 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5351  
 

Short Description:  TELEHEALTH-DIABETES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Patricia R. Bellock 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Insurance Code. In provisions concerning coverage for telehealth services, if an 
individual or group policy of accident or health insurance provides coverage for telehealth services, it 
must provide coverage for licensed dietitians, nutritionists, and diabetes educators who counsel senior 
diabetes patients in the patients' homes to remove the hurdle of transportation for patients to receive 
treatment. Amends the Illinois Public Aid Code. Provides that the Department of Healthcare and Family 
Services may authorize licensed dietitians, nutritionists, and diabetes educators to counsel senior 
diabetes patients in the patients' homes to remove the hurdle of transportation for patients to receive 
treatment. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Insurance: Health & Life Committee 

 

 
HB 5392  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 BHE OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Higher Education and 



the Illinois Math and Science Academy for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General 
Funds $229,022,200; Other State Funds $4,980,000; Federal Funds $5,500,000; Total $239,502,200. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5393  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 CSU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Chicago 
State University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $32,697,400; Other 
State Funds $1,907,000; Total $34,604,400. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5394  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 EIU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Eastern 
Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $38,678,100; Other 
State Funds $8,000; Total $38,686,100. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 5395  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 GSU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Governors 
State University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $21,656,000. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5396  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 NEIU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of 
Northeastern Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds 
$33,209,000. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5397  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 WIU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 



Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Western 
Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $46,300,700; Other 
State Funds $10,000; Total $46,310,700. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5398  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 ISU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Illinois 
State University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $65,004,000; Other 
State Funds $50,000; Total $65,054,000. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5399  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 NIU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Northern 
Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $81,983,500; Other 
State Funds $36,000; Total $82,019,500. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 



  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5400  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 SIU OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Southern 
Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $179,913,800; 
Other State Funds $1,269,000; Total $181,182,800. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5401  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 U OF I OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of the 
University of Illinois for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $583,005,900; 
Other State Funds $5,805,700; Total $588,811,600. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5402  
 



Short Description:  $FY19 ICCB OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Illinois Community College 
Board for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $202,715,100; Other State 
Funds $116,825,000; Federal Funds $43,000,000; Total $362,540,100. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5403  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 ISAC OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Illinois Student Assistance 
Commission for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018: General Funds $434,969,900; Other State Funds 
$10,580,000; Federal Funds $274,753,700; Total $729,303,600. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5404  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 SURS OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the State Universities Retirement 
System for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $1,414,498,000; Other State 



Funds $140,000,000; Total $1,554,498,000. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5405  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 SUCCS OCE 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the State Universities Civil Service 
System for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $1,082,200. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5429  
 

Short Description:  $FY18 SUPPLEMENTAL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 



HB 5430  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 CAPITAL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Makes appropriations and reappropriations for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5431  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 MEMBER INITIATIVES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jim Durkin 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Appropriations and reappropriations for capital projects for the Department of Commerce and 
Economic Opportunity for the fiscal years beginning July 1, 2018. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5450  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Norine K. Hammond 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning terms. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5451  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Norine K. Hammond 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Western Illinois University Law. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning 
creating the Board of Trustees. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5458  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-GRAD GRANT PROGRAM 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Norine K. Hammond 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. In the provision governing the graduation incentive grant 
program, removes the requirement that the Board of Higher Education annually submit to the Governor 
and the General Assembly a budgetary recommendation for the grants and the requirement that the 
Board notify applicants that the award of grants is contingent upon the availability of appropriated funds. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 



 
HB 5460  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-COLLEGE SAVINGS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Norine K. Hammond 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Treasurer Act and Illinois Prepaid Tuition Act. Provides that, beginning on July 1, 
2018, for a designated beneficiary or qualified beneficiary who is a State resident, no contributions toward 
the College Savings Pool or the purchase of an Illinois prepaid tuition contract may be considered in 
evaluating the financial situation of the beneficiary or be deemed a financial resource or form of financial 
aid or assistance to the beneficiary for purposes of determining the eligibility of the beneficiary for any 
scholarship, grant, or monetary assistance awarded by the Illinois Student Assistance Commission. 
Provides that contributions toward the College Savings Pool or the purchase of an Illinois prepaid tuition 
contract may not reduce the amount of any scholarship, grant, or monetary assistance that the 
beneficiary is eligible to be awarded by the Commission. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5462  
 

Short Description:  PROCUREMENT-HIGHER ED COMPACT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Norine K. Hammond 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Re-enacts a provision concerning the applicability of the Code 
to public institutions of higher education. Extends the repeal of the provision from December 31, 2016 to 
December 31, 2021. Provides that the Code does not apply to procurements made by or on behalf of 
public institutions of higher education for goods or services procured through a contract with a vendor 
approved by the Midwest Higher Education Compact. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 



HB 5471  
 

Short Description:  UNIV RETAIL SALES-INST DEFINED 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Jay Hoffman 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the University Credit and Retail Sales Act. Changes the short title of the Act to the Higher 
Education Institution Credit and Retail Sales Act. Defines "State institution of higher learning" to mean a 
university, college, community college, or junior college in this State that is publicly supported by taxes 
levied and collected within the State on income, sales, or property. Provides that "State institution of 
higher learning" does not include a post-secondary educational institution as defined under the Private 
College Act. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation without reimbursement. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/5/2018 House Assigned to Consumer Protection Committee 

 

 
HB 5495  
 

Short Description:  NURSE&PHYSICIAN-RURAL HOSPITAL 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Patricia R. Bellock 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Nurse Practice Act and the Physician Assistant Practice Act of 1987. Provides that the 
Secretary of Financial and Professional Regulation shall by rule provide for advanced practice registered 
nurses and physician assistants to admit patients to rural hospitals where they have privileges. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5514  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-1YR COLLEGE PROMISE 

 



House Sponsors 
Rep. Justin Slaughter 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the State Finance Act to create the First-Year College Promise Fund as a special fund in the 
State treasury. Amends the Higher Education Student Assistance Act. Requires the Illinois Student 
Assistance Commission to implement and administer a program to award First-Year College Promise 
grants to low-income Illinois residents seeking an associate degree from a public community college or a 
bachelor's degree from a public university. Provides that a First-Year College Promise grant shall be 
equal to the cost of tuition and mandatory fees at the public institution for 2 semesters of enrollment. Sets 
forth the terms and conditions of the program. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5536  
 

Short Description:  COMMUNITY COLLEGE ACT-VARIOUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Chad Hays 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Public Community College Act. Provides that the Illinois Community College Board may, 
in collaboration with community colleges, furnish information for State and federal accountability 
purposes, promote student and institutional improvement, and meet research needs. Provides that the 
Board may review and approve or disapprove (rather than participate in and recommend approval or 
disapproval of) any contract or agreement that community colleges enter into with any organization, 
association, educational institution, or government agency to provide educational services and may 
monitor the performance under any contract. Requires the board of trustees of each community college 
district to file a written or electronic copy of its annual budget with the Board. Provides that any graduate 
from a recognized high school or student otherwise qualified to attend a public community college and 
residing outside a community college district may attend any recognized public community college in this 
State at the tuition rate of a student residing in the district; requires the Board to pay the community 
college the difference between the in-district and out-of-district tuition amounts. Provides that, for tuition 
purposes, a student shall be classified as a resident of a community college district after establishing the 
30-day residency requirement of the district. Repeals provisions governing indemnification, deferred 
maintenance grants, the College and Career Readiness Pilot Program, a directory of graduating 
vocational and technical school students, and other items. Makes other changes. Amends the State 
Finance Act to make a conforming change. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 



 

 
HB 5629  
 

Short Description:  COMMUNITY COLLEGE-CONTRACTS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Robert W. Pritchard 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Public Community College Act. Provides that the board of trustees of a community 
college district may enter into a contract for goods or services procured from a competitively bid group 
purchase contract without adhering to the competitively bid contract requirements under the Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5657  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-CAPITAL PLAN REVIEW 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Mark Batinick 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Removes a requirement that each State university submit 
its plans for capital improvements of non-instructional facilities to the Board of Higher Education for 
review under certain circumstances. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5696  
 

Short Description:  UNDERREPRESENTED STUDENTS ACT 

 



House Sponsors 
Rep. Emanuel Chris Welch 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Bridge Program for Underrepresented Students Act. Defines terms. Provides that each 
public university in this State may establish a Bridge Program for underrepresented students. Specifies 
program requirements. Provides that a public university that establishes a Bridge Program shall, on or 
before September 1, 2019 and on or before September 1 of each subsequent year, publish on its website 
and make available to the public a report on the Program. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 House Assigned to Higher Education Committee 

 

 
HB 5746  
 

Short Description:  HGHER ED-SEXUAL VIOLENCE STUDY 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Michelle Mussman, John Connor, Katie Stuart, Deb Conroy and Sam Yingling 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Provides that, beginning with the 2019-2020 academic 
year, each public or private higher education institution shall require all entering freshmen to receive, 
during a period of orientation or in an introductory course offered by the institution, instruction aimed at 
increasing the awareness and prevention of sexual violence and hate crimes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5758  
 

Short Description:  DUAL CREDIT ACT-STATE CAMPUS 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Monica Bristow 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Dual Credit Quality Act. Provides that an institution may not offer a dual credit program 
with a high school in this State if the institution's main campus is not located in this State. Prohibits the 



Illinois Community College Board and the Board of Higher Education from approving an institution's offer 
of dual credit courses if the institution's main campus is not located in this State. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
HB 5788  
 

Short Description:  PROCURE-RENEW ENERGY RESOURCES 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. Katie Stuart 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that, among other types of contracts, renewable 
energy resources contracts and leases may be entered into for a period of time deemed to be in the best 
interest of the State but not exceeding 15 years inclusive of proposed contract or lease renewals. Makes 
conforming changes. Defines "renewable energy resources". Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
SB 398  
 

Short Description:  ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT-TECH 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Emil Jones, III 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      Creates the Economic Development Act of 2017. Contains only a short title provision. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 3rd Reading 



 

 
SB 599  
 

Short Description:  STUDENT ONLINE PERSONAL INFO 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Michael Connelly-Patricia Van Pelt 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Higher Education Student Online Personal Information Protection Act. Provides that the 
operator of an Internet website, online service, online application, or mobile application used primarily for 
higher education purposes and designed and marketed for higher education purposes shall not knowingly 
(1) engage in targeted advertising on the operator's site, service, or application or target advertising on 
any other site, service, or application when the targeting of the advertising is based upon any information 
that the operator has acquired because of the use of that operator's site, service, or application; (2) use 
information created or gathered by the operator's site, service, or application to amass a profile about a 
student, except in furtherance of higher education purposes; (3) sell a student's information; or (4) 
disclose covered information, as defined in the Act, without a student's consent. Sets forth exceptions and 
other provisions concerning the construction and application of the Act. Effective January 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 Senate Re-assigned to Judiciary 

 

 
SB 645  
 

Short Description:  ETHICS-ACCESS TO RECORDS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Heather A. Steans 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Provides that if an officer or employee objects 
to a request for information by an Executive Inspector General based on any applicable rights or 
protections under State or federal law, the officer or employee may seek resolution of the objection by the 
Executive Ethics Commission. Provides that if an officer or employee refuses or fails to provide 
information requested by an Executive Inspector General, the Executive Inspector General may notify the 
Executive Ethics Commission and seek an order compelling the officer or employee to produce the 
information requested by the Executive Inspector General. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/15/2018 Senate To Subcommittee on Governmental Operations 

 

 



SB 888  
 

Short Description:  COMMUNITY COLL-NURSING DEGREE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Andy Manar, Sue Rezin, Cristina Castro, Tim Bivins and Steven M. Landek-Melinda Bush 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Public Community College Act. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning the 
Illinois Community College Board. 
 
Senate Committee Amendment No. 1 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the Public Community College Act. Allows a 
board of trustees of a community college district to establish and offer a baccalaureate-level nursing 
education program and confer a bachelor of science degree in nursing upon the meeting of specified 
conditions. Requires approval of both the Illinois Community College Board and Board of Higher 
Education. Limits the number of programs that may be approved to 20 until August 31, 2022. Requires 
the Illinois Community College Board to conduct a statewide evaluation of nursing programs established 
under the provisions and report on the results of the evaluation by July 1, 2022. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  8/4/2017 Senate Pursuant to Senate Rule 3-9(b) / Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 926  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-STUDENT-MONEY OWED 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Emil Jones, III 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities and community colleges in 
Illinois. Provides that a public university or community college district may not prohibit a student from 
registering for classes or refuse to issue a student transcript solely because the student owes the 
university or district money. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 Senate Re-assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 1560  
 

Short Description:  CAMPUS FREE EXPRESSION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Michael Connelly 



 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Campus Free Expression Act. Deems the outdoor areas of campuses of institutions of 
higher education (both private and public) as traditional public forums. Provides that institutions of higher 
education may maintain and enforce reasonable time, place, and manner restrictions in service of a 
significant institutional interest only when such restrictions employ clear, published, content-neutral, and 
viewpoint-neutral criteria and provide for ample alternative means of expression, with any such 
restrictions allowing for members of the higher education community to spontaneously and 
contemporaneously assemble. Provides that any person who wishes to engage in noncommercial, 
expressive activity on campus shall be permitted to do so freely, as long as the person's conduct is not 
unlawful (subject to an institution's restrictions). Contains enforcement provisions. Amends the Campus 
Demonstrations Policy Act to make a corresponding change. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 Senate Re-assigned to Judiciary 

 

 
SB 1773  
 

Short Description:  DHFS-HOSPITALS-PAYMENTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Heather A. Steans-Patricia Van Pelt-Jacqueline Y. Collins-Mattie Hunter and Dave Syverson-Iris Y. 
Martinez 
 
House Sponsors 
(Rep. Gregory Harris-Patricia R. Bellock-Juliana Stratton-Sara Feigenholtz-Tom Demmer, Robyn Gabel, 
Ryan Spain, Luis Arroyo and Mary E. Flowers) 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. In a provision permitting a 
nursing facility to appeal a change in its Minimum Data Set rate, provides that the facility shall be 
permitted to offer any and all additional documentation during the appeal hearing that is necessary to 
refute the State's findings (rather than the facility may not offer any additional documentation during the 
appeal hearing, but may identify documentation provided during the on-site review that may support a 
specific area of documentation deemed deficient by the Department of Healthcare and Family Services). 
 
Senate Committee Amendment No. 1 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the Illinois Public Aid Code. In provisions 
concerning payments to nursing facilities, provides that the Department of Healthcare and Family 
Services shall provide an update on the status of payments from both the General Revenue Fund and the 
Long-Term Care Provider Fund for expedited and non-expedited facilities by schedule. Provides that the 
Department may provide the information monthly electronically, post it on the Department's website, or 
provide it upon request in compliance with this requirement. Effective immediately. 
 
House Committee Amendment No. 3 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the Illinois Public Aid Code. Makes a technical 
change in a Section concerning the purpose of the Medical Assistance Article. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 8 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the Illinois Health Facilities Planning Act. 



Expands the definition of health care facility to include any project the Department of Healthcare and 
Family Services certifies was approved by the Hospital Transformation Review Committee as a project 
subject to the hospital's transformation as provided under the Illinois Public Aid Code. Amends the 
Emergency Medical Services (EMS) Systems Act. Requires the Department of Public Health to issue an 
annual freestanding emergency center license to certain facilities. Amends the Illinois Public Aid Code. 
Requires the Department of Healthcare and Family Services to establish a cost-based reimbursement 
methodology for determining payments to hospitals for approved graduate medical education programs 
for dates of service on and after July 1, 2018. Contains provisions concerning an amendment to the 
Illinois Title XIX State Plan defining graduate medical education (GME); GME payments to hospitals 
including such costs in support of clients enrolled in Medicaid managed care entities; and a requirement 
that the Department take all actions necessary for reimbursement to be effective for dates of service on 
and after July 1, 2018. Defines terms and grants the Department emergency rulemaking authority. 
Extends the time period under which certain hospitals shall be designated a safety-net hospital. Contains 
provisions concerning: hospital assessments for State fiscal years 2019 through 2024; a requirement that 
certain hospital assessments be paid in monthly installments; hospital assessments for hospital providers 
that did not conduct, operate, or maintain a hospital in the year that is the basis of the calculation of the 
assessment; disbursements from the Hospital Provider Fund for State fiscal years 2019 through 2024; the 
continuation of hospital access payments on or after July 1, 2018; rate increase-based adjustments; the 
calculation of graduate medical education payments; Alzheimer's treatment access payments; safety-net 
hospital, private critical access hospital, and outpatient high volume access payments; Medicaid 
dependent or high volume hospital access payments; trauma care access payments; long-term acute 
care access payments; small public hospital access payments; psychiatric care access payments; 
emergency rules to implement the hospital access payments; increase capitation payments to capitated 
managed care organizations; and other matters. Extends the repeal date of certain assessments on 
inpatient and outpatient services to July 1, 2020 (rather than July 1, 2018). Requires the Department to 
preserve payment methodologies for certain hospital assessments pending federal approval of changes 
made under the amendatory Act to those hospital assessments. Contains provisions concerning 
reimbursement for inpatient psychiatric services beginning July 1, 2020; reimbursement increases for 
inpatient rehabilitation services; add-on payments for outpatient expensive devices and drugs; and other 
matters. Requires the Department, in conjunction with the Hospital Transformation Review Committee, to 
develop a hospital transformation program to provide financial assistance to hospitals in transforming 
their services and care models to better align with the needs of the communities they serve. Provides that 
the Hospital Transformation Review Committee shall consist of 14 appointed members and that 9 of the 
14 committee members must first approve any rule adopted to implement the hospital transformation 
program before the rule is submitted to the Joint Committee on Administrative Rules. Requires the 
Department to develop reimbursement methodologies to recognize the importance of out-of-state 
hospitals located in states that border Illinois and provide access to specialty hospital services, with some 
exceptions. Makes other changes. Effective immediately, but the Act does not take effect at all unless 
Senate Bill 1573 of the 100th General Assembly, as amended, becomes law. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 9 
     In a provision concerning the composition of the Hospital Transformation Review Committee, provides 
that the Chair and Vice-Chair (rather than the Chair and Co-Chair) cannot be appointed by the same 
appointing authority and must be from different political parties. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/12/2018 Senate Public Act . . . . . . . . . 100-0581 

 

 
SB 1936  
 

Short Description:  REPEAL FUNDS-PROJECTS-BOARDS 



 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pamela J. Althoff 
 
House Sponsors 
(Rep. William Davis) 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Executive Reorganization Implementation Act. Makes a technical change in a Section 
concerning the short title. 
 
Senate Floor Amendment No. 3 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Amends the State Finance Act. Repeals various 
special funds in the State treasury, and amends various Acts to make conforming changes. Repeals 
various programs, studies, grants, projects, initiatives, boards, councils, and reports. Amends the Election 
Code. Makes changes concerning certain fees and reimbursement. Amends the Illinois Act on Aging. 
Makes changes concerning eligibility requirements for the Community Care Program and the Rural Senior 
Citizen Program. Amends the Metropolitan Pier and Exposition Authority Act to remove a requirement 
that the Metropolitan Pier and Exposition Authority to make rules necessary to assure access to 
economically disadvantaged persons to certain positions. Amends the State Housing Act to repeal certain 
provisions concerning commissioners and the collection and distribution of information. Amends the 
Illinois Geographic Information Council Act to make changes to the membership of the Illinois Geographic 
Information Council. Amends the Blighted Vacant Areas Development Act of 1949 to make changes 
concerning surety bonds. Amends the Environmental Protection Act to make changes in provisions 
concerning a materials disposal ban, the Solid Waste Management Fund, white goods, certain waste 
materials, prohibited activities, and the Used Tire Management Fund. Amends the Illinois Solid Waste 
Management Act and the Interstate Ozone Transport Oversight Act to make changes to the 
responsibilities of the Department of Commerce and Economic Opportunity under the Acts. Amends the 
Environmental Toxicology Act to remove provisions concerning the State Remedial Action Priority List. 
Repeals various provisions of Acts. Repeals the Public Education Affinity Credit Card Act, the Electric 
Vehicle Act, the Illinois Emergency Employment Development Act, the Particle Accelerator Land 
Acquisition Act, the Illinois Economic Development Board Act, the Illinois Children's Savings Accounts 
Act, the Task Force on Inventorying Employment Restrictions Act, the Local Government Debt Offering 
Act, the Home Ownership Made Easy Act, the Blighted Areas Redevelopment Act of 1947, the Urban 
Community Conservation Act, the Urban Renewal Consolidation Act of 1961, the Urban Flooding 
Awareness Act, the High Risk Youth Career Development Act, the Excellence in Alzheimer's Disease 
Center Treatment Act, the Green Infrastructure for Clean Water Act, the Recycled Newsprint Act, the 
Illinois Food, Farms, and Jobs Act, the Sorry Works! Pilot Program Act, and the Restricted Call Registry 
Act. Makes other changes. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation without 
reimbursement. Contains severability provisions. Effective immediately. 
 
House Floor Amendment No. 1 
     Deletes provisions changing the Election Code. Deletes certain provisions changing the Illinois Act on 
the Aging. Deletes provisions repealing a Section of the Department of Commerce and Economic 
Opportunity Law of the Civil Administrative Code of Illinois. Deletes provisions repealing the Electric 
Vehicle Act. Deletes provisions changing the Illinois Emergency Employment Development Act. Deletes 
provisions repealing a Section of the Illinois Emergency Employment Development Act. Deletes 
provisions changing the Capital Spending Accountability Law. Deletes provisions repealing the Local 
Government Debt Offering Act. Deletes provisions repealing a Section of the Metropolitan Pier and 
Exposition Authority Act. Deletes provisions repealing a Section of the Housing Development and 
Construction Act. Deletes provisions repealing a Section of the Redevelopment Project Rehousing and 
Capital Improvements Act. Deletes provisions repealing the Blighted Areas Redevelopment Act of 1947. 
Deletes provisions changing a Section of the Blighted Vacant Areas Development Act of 1949. Deletes 
provisions repealing the Urban Community Conservation Act. Deletes provisions repealing the Urban 
Renewal Consolidation Act of 1961. Deletes provisions repealing the High Risk Youth Career 



Development Act. Deletes provisions repealing a Section of the Environmental Protection Act. Deletes 
provisions repealing the Recycled Newsprint Use Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of Concurrence House Amendment(s) 1 - 
February 14, 2018 

 

 
SB 2172  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Michael Connelly, William E. Brady, Jim Oberweis-Tom Rooney and Pamela J. Althoff-Jil Tracy 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Pension Code. Restricts participation in the General Assembly Retirement System 
to persons who became participants before the effective date. Provides separate benefits for persons 
who, on or after 6 months after the effective date, first become participants or members under the State 
Universities or Downstate Teachers Article or a noncovered participant under the State Employees 
Article. Requires those retirement systems to establish a defined contribution plan for certain members. In 
the IMRF, Chicago Municipal, Cook County, Cook County Forest Preserve, Chicago Laborers, Chicago 
Park District, Metropolitan Water Reclamation District, and Chicago Teachers Articles, establishes similar 
benefits if the governing body of the unit of local government adopts those benefits by resolution or 
ordinance. In the State Employee, State Universities, and Downstate Teachers Articles, requires those 
Systems to offer certain inactive members the opportunity to elect to receive an accelerated pension 
benefit payment equal to 70% of the net present value of their pension benefits in lieu of receiving any 
pension benefit. In the 5 State-funded retirement systems and the Chicago Teachers Pension Fund, 
makes funding changes. In the State Universities and Downstate Teachers Articles, shifts certain costs to 
the local employer. In the Chicago Teachers Article, requires the State to contribute $215,200,000 for 
fiscal year 2017 and provides a continuing appropriation from the Common School Fund for that 
contribution. Amends the Budget Stabilization Act. Provides for the transfer of certain amounts from the 
General Revenue Fund to the Pension Stabilization Fund. Makes other changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  4/7/2017 Senate Rule 3-9(a) / Re-referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2173  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Michael Connelly-William E. Brady, Jim Oberweis and Pamela J. Althoff-Jil Tracy 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the General Assembly, State Employee, State Universities, Downstate Teacher, and Chicago 
Teacher Articles of the Illinois Pension Code. Requires active Tier 1 employees to elect either to (i) have 



automatic annual increases in retirement and survivor's annuities delayed and reduced or (ii) maintain 
their current benefit package with additional limitations on pensionable salary. Provides that a Tier 1 
employee who elects item (i) is entitled to have future increases in income treated as pensionable 
income, have contributions reduced to a specified rate, and receive a consideration payment of 10% of 
contributions made prior to the election. Provides that a Tier 1 employee who elects item (ii) is not eligible 
to have future increases in income treated as pensionable income. Makes funding changes. Amends the 
State Pension Funds Continuing Appropriation Act to provide a continuing appropriation for the amounts 
of the consideration payments. Amends various Acts to make conforming changes. Amends the Illinois 
Educational Labor Relations Act and the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act to prohibit bargaining and 
interest arbitration regarding certain changes made by the amendatory Act and to provide that no action 
of the employer taken to implement that prohibition shall give rise to an unfair labor practice under those 
Acts; exempts certain existing agreements. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation 
without reimbursement. Makes other changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  4/7/2017 Senate Rule 3-9(a) / Re-referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2193  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-GARS-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Kyle McCarter-Christine Radogno and William E. Brady 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the General Assembly Article of the Illinois Pension Code. Restricts participation in the 
General Assembly Retirement System to persons who became participants before the effective date of 
the amendatory Act. Beginning in fiscal year 2018, makes funding changes. Requires the Board to 
recalculate and recertify the amount of the State's required contribution for fiscal year 2018. Establishes a 
voluntary defined contribution plan for certain Tier 1 members and makes conforming changes in the 
Retirement Systems Reciprocal Act (Article 20 of the Code). Repeals provisions concerning a defined 
contribution plan added by Public Act 98-599, which has been held unconstitutional. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  5/19/2017 Senate Rule 3-9(a) / Re-referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2194  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. William E. Brady-Tom Rooney-Kyle McCarter 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Employee, State Universities, Downstate Teacher, and Chicago Teacher Articles of 



the Illinois Pension Code. Requires active Tier 1 employees to elect either to (i) have automatic annual 
increases in retirement and survivor's annuities delayed and reduced or (ii) maintain their current benefit 
package with additional limitations on pensionable salary. Provides that a Tier 1 employee who elects 
item (i) is entitled to have future increases in income treated as pensionable income, have contributions 
reduced to a specified rate, and receive a consideration payment of 10% of contributions made prior to 
the election. Provides that a Tier 1 employee who elects item (ii) is not eligible to have future increases in 
income treated as pensionable income. Makes funding changes. Amends the State Pension Funds 
Continuing Appropriation Act to provide a continuing appropriation for the amounts of the consideration 
payments. Amends various Acts to make conforming changes. Amends the Illinois Educational Labor 
Relations Act and the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act to prohibit bargaining and interest arbitration 
regarding certain changes made by the amendatory Act and to provide that no action of the employer 
taken to implement that prohibition shall give rise to an unfair labor practice under those Acts; exempts 
certain existing agreements. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation without 
reimbursement. Makes other changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  8/4/2017 Senate Rule 3-9(a) / Re-referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2195  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. William E. Brady-Kyle McCarter-Tom Rooney 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Pension Code. Provides optional separate benefits for persons who, on or after 6 
months after the effective date, first become participants or members under the State Universities or 
Downstate Teachers Article or a noncovered participant under the State Employee Article. Contains 
provisions concerning retirement conditions, the amount of the retirement annuity, the amount of the 
annual increases to the retirement annuity, the calculation of salary, and the amount of certain survivor 
benefits. Sets forth the amount of employee and employer contributions. Requires those retirement 
systems to establish a defined contribution plan for certain members. In the Chicago Teachers Article, 
establishes similar benefits if the governing body of the unit of local government adopts those benefits by 
resolution or ordinance. In the State Employee, State Universities, and Downstate Teachers Articles, 
requires those Systems to offer certain inactive members the opportunity to elect to receive an 
accelerated pension benefit payment equal to 70% of the net present value of their pension benefits in 
lieu of receiving any pension benefit. In the State Employee, State Universities, and Downstate Teachers 
Articles, makes funding changes. In the State Universities and Downstate Teachers Articles, shifts certain 
costs to the local employer. Makes other changes. Amends the State Mandates Act to require 
implementation without reimbursement. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  8/4/2017 Senate Rule 3-9(a) / Re-referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2197  
 



Short Description:  PENCD-SURS-EMPLOYER NORMAL CST 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Kyle McCarter-Dan McConchie 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Universities Article of the Illinois Pension Code. Requires the actual employer to 
contribute an amount equal to the full employer's normal cost of the benefits earned under this System 
that result from employment by that employer, to be paid to the System on a payroll-by-payroll basis, 
using the percentage of earnings determined on a system-wide basis and certified by the System to all 
employers for use in the applicable fiscal year. Requires immediate and annual certification of the 
applicable percentage rate. Amends the State Mandates Act to require implementation without 
reimbursement. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  4/27/2017 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2204  
 

Short Description:  FINANCE-U OF I HOSPITAL FUND 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Kyle McCarter 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Finance Act. Removes language concerning one-time or annual transfers from the 
General Revenue Fund to the University of Illinois Hospital Services Fund. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  8/4/2017 Senate Rule 3-9(a) / Re-referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2221  
 

Short Description:  USE/OCC-AIRPLANE FUEL 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Martin A. Sandoval 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Finance Act, the Retailers' Occupation Tax Act, the Counties Code, the Illinois 
Municipal Code, the Metro-East Park and Recreation District Act, the Local Mass Transit District Act, the 
Regional Transportation Authority Act, and the Water Commission Act of 1985. Provides that, for the 
purposes of local sales tax sourcing, a retail sale of fuel or petroleum products used by an aircraft shall be 
deemed to be a retail sale at the place where the fuel or petroleum products are delivered to the aircraft. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  6/30/2017 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2234  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED CENTERS EXCELLENCE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Requires the Board of Higher Education to establish a 
uniform admission process online, which must be used at all public institutions of higher education; sets 
forth what components this admission process must include. Requires the Board (i) to ensure that any 
high school student in this State with a 3.0 cumulative grade point average or better on a 4.0 scale (or the 
equivalent on a 5.0 scale) receives access to the opportunity of higher education and (ii) to guarantee 
admission to a public university; requires cooperation by the State Board of Education, high schools, and 
public universities. Requires the Board to conduct a study of the academic programs offered at each 
public university campus. Sets forth the Board's duties concerning the study. Requires the Board to use 
the results of the study and other specified factors to determine which academic programs should be 
prioritized at campuses of public universities and to create and designate Higher Education Strategic 
Centers of Excellence. Requires the Board to work with the Illinois Community College Board to develop 
recommendations to integrate community colleges into this plan. Sets forth additional Board of Higher 
Education duties concerning evaluating programmatic expansions and new programs and studying 
student financial aid and multi-year budgeting. Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public 
universities to make conforming changes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 Senate Postponed - Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2242  
 

Short Description:  EMPLOYEE SICK LEAVE BENEFITS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. John G. Mulroe 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Employee Sick Leave Act. Permits an employee to use personal sick leave benefits for 
leave an employee is entitled to under the Victims' Economic Security and Safety Act. Permits an 
employer to limit the use of personal sick leave benefits for leave an employee is entitled to under the 
Victims' Economic Security and Safety Act. Provides that the Employee Sick Leave Act does not limit or 
extend the period of leave to which an employee is entitled under the Victims' Economic Security and 
Safety Act, regardless of whether the employee receives sick leave compensation during that leave. 
Effective immediately. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/24/2018 Senate Assigned to Labor 

 

 
SB 2248  
 

Short Description:  ETHICS-SEX HARASSMENT TRAINING 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Daniel Biss-Jacqueline Y. Collins-Toi W. Hutchinson-Cristina Castro, Laura M. Murphy, Julie A. 
Morrison, Melinda Bush-Iris Y. Martinez, Linda Holmes and Michael E. Hastings 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Provides for the implementation of a sexual 
harassment training program to be completed by specified State officials and employees, and to be 
conducted by the appropriate State agency of those State officials and employees. Provides additional 
requirements for operation of the program, and for reporting and completion of sexual harassment 
training under the program. Authorizes the Legislative Ethics Commission to make rulings, issue 
recommendations, and impose administrative fines in connection with findings of sexual harassment. 
Authorizes the Legislative Inspector General to receive and investigate allegations of sexual harassment. 
Requires ethics officers to provide guidance to officers and employees in registering complaints about 
sexual harassment with the Legislative Inspector General. Provides for sexual harassment complaint 
procedures. Amends the Lobbyist Registration Act. Requires the Secretary of State to receive and 
investigate allegations of sexual harassment, and to immediately transmit those allegations to the 
Secretary of State Inspector General. Provides that each natural person required to register as a lobbyist 
under the Act must complete a program of sexual harassment training no later than 30 days after 
registration or renewal of registration under the Act. Defines terms. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  10/24/2017 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2255  
 

Short Description:  PROMPT PAYMENT-INTEREST 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Laura M. Murphy 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Prompt Payment Act. Provides that, for bills approved for payment on or after July 
1, 2018, the prompt payment interest rate for the fiscal year shall be the greater of (i) 3% or (ii) 2 times the 
percentage increase, if any, in the Consumer Price Index For All Urban Consumers during the 12-month 
period immediately preceding the first day of the fiscal year (currently, 1% generally and 2% for certain 
bills submitted under Article V of the Illinois Public Aid Code). Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  1/24/2018 Senate Assigned to Appropriations I 

 

 
SB 2259  
 

Short Description:  INC TX-EDUCATION CREDIT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Laura M. Murphy, Kimberly A. Lightford-Thomas Cullerton, Scott M. Bennett, Antonio Muñoz, 
Jacqueline Y. Collins, Cristina Castro, Napoleon Harris, III, Patricia Van Pelt, Melinda Bush and Michael 
E. Hastings 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Creates a credit for taxpayers who (1) have an adjusted gross 
income of $200,000 or less and (2) are college or university students or may claim a college or university 
student as a dependent. Provides that the credit shall be equal to a portion of the tuition and fee 
expenses paid by the taxpayer during the taxable year on behalf of the qualifying student. Sets forth the 
amount of the credit. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/24/2018 Senate Assigned to Revenue 

 

 
SB 2279  
 
Committee Hearing: 
State Government Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  STATE CONTRACT FUNDING 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Laura M. Murphy and Cristina Castro 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that neither the State of Illinois nor an agency thereof 
shall enter into a contract, nor shall a contract be awarded, if there is not, prior to entering into such 
contract, an appropriation enacted for the funding of that contract. Provides that the State contract 
funding requirement applies to State contracts which may be entered into on or after the effective date of 
this amendatory Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Postponed - State Government 

 

 
SB 2296  
 



Short Description:  ADVANCE DIRECTIVES REGISTRY 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Julie A. Morrison-Laura M. Murphy 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Department of Public Health Powers and Duties Law of the Civil Administrative Code of 
Illinois. Provides that the Department of Public Health shall establish a registry, to be known as the 
Advance Directives Registry, under which residents of the State may submit specified advance directive 
forms to the Department. Provides that information in the Registry shall be made available to hospitals 
licensed under the Hospital Licensing Act or organized under the University of Illinois Hospital Act. 
Provides that in the absence of gross negligence or willful misconduct, the Department and its employees 
are immune from any civil or criminal liability in connection with the creation and maintenance of the 
Registry. Provides that the Department shall adopt any rules necessary to implement these provisions 
and shall provide information regarding use of the Registry on its website. Provides that a person who 
knowingly submits a document to the Registry without authorization or assists in such submission shall be 
guilty of a Class A misdemeanor. Contains other provisions concerning the Registry. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/7/2018 Senate Postponed - Public Health 

 

 
SB 2298  
 

Short Description:  INDUSTRIAL HEMP ACT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Toi W. Hutchinson-David Koehler, Cristina Castro and Heather A. Steans-Omar Aquino 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Industrial Hemp Act. Provides that a person desiring to grow, cultivate, or process 
industrial hemp or industrial hemp products must be licensed by the Department of Agriculture. Provides 
that the application for a license shall include the name and address of the applicant and the legal 
description of the land area, including Global Positioning System coordinates, to be used to cultivate 
industrial hemp. Provides that the Department may determine, by rule, the duration of a license and the 
requirements for license renewal. Preempts home rule powers. Amends the Illinois Noxious Weed Law. 
Provides that "noxious weed" does not include industrial hemp. Amends the Cannabis Control Act. 
Provides that "cannabis" does not include industrial hemp. Makes conforming changes in the State 
Finance Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/24/2018 Senate Assigned to Agriculture 

 

 
SB 2333  
 

Short Description:  EQUAL PAY DISCLOSE PAY AMOUNT 

 



Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Michael Connelly-Tom Rooney-John F. Curran-Sue Rezin, Karen McConnaughay, Chris Nybo, 
Chapin Rose, Paul Schimpf, Neil Anderson and Dale Fowler-Pamela J. Althoff 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Equal Pay Act of 2003. Provides that it is unlawful for an employer to require an employee 
to sign a contract or waiver that would prohibit the employee from disclosing or discussing the employee's 
wage or salary; however, an employer may prohibit a human resources employee, a supervisor, or any 
other employee whose job responsibilities require or allow access to other employees' wage or salary 
information from disclosing such information without prior written consent from the employee whose 
information is sought or requested. Provides that it is unlawful for an employer to seek the wage or salary 
history of a prospective employee from the prospective employee or a current or former employer or to 
require that a prospective employee's prior wage or salary history meet certain criteria, with some 
exceptions. Provides that an employer against whom an action is brought alleging a violation of the Act's 
prohibition against gender-based wage differentials and who, within the previous 3 years and prior to the 
commencement of the action, has completed a self-evaluation of the employer's pay practices and can 
demonstrate that reasonable progress has been made towards eliminating wage differentials based on 
gender for the same or substantially similar work in accordance with that evaluation shall have an 
affirmative defense to liability. Provides that an employer who cannot demonstrate that the evaluation was 
reasonable in detail and scope shall not be entitled to an affirmative defense, but is liable for any civil fine 
of: (1) up to $500 per employee affected, if the employer has fewer than 4 employees; or (2) up to $2,500 
per employee affected, if the employer has 4 or more employees. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/30/2018 Senate Assigned to Labor 

 

 
SB 2334  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Public Health Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  HOSPITALS-METAL DETECTORS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Laura M. Murphy 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the University of Illinois Hospital Act and Hospital Licensing Act. Provides that a hospital shall 
maintain a metal detector at each point of entry into the hospital. Provides that a hospital shall ensure that 
all members of the public, other than the employees of the hospital who display proper credentials, who 
enter the hospital at a point of entry are subjected to screening by a metal detector. Provides that 
individuals subject to screening shall include, but not be limited to, individuals in wheelchairs. Defines 
"point of entry". Effective July 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Public Health 

 

 



SB 2350  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION-TECH 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. John J. Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Career and Workforce Transition Act. Makes a technical change in a Section concerning 
the short title. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2419  
 

Short Description:  SURGICAL ASSISTS-CERTIFICATION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pamela J. Althoff-Iris Y. Martinez 
 
House Sponsors 
(Rep. Daniel J. Burke) 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Registered Surgical Assistant and Registered Surgical Technologist Title Protection Act. 
Provides that a person qualifies for registration as a surgical assistant if he or she is currently certified by 
the National Commission for the Certification of Surgical Assistants (rather than the National Surgical 
Assistant Association). Provides that in order for a registrant to renew his or her surgical assistant 
registration or surgical technologist registration, he or she must maintain certain current certification. 
Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 House Referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
SB 2429  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Human Services Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-ADULT DENTAL SERVICES 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Omar Aquino-Pat McGuire-William R. Haine 
 



Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Provides that the Department of 
Healthcare and Family Services shall provide dental services to an adult who is otherwise eligible for 
assistance under the medical assistance program. Provides that targeted dental services, as set forth in a 
specified exhibit in a federal consent decree, that are provided to adults under the medical assistance 
program shall be reimbursed at the rates set forth in a specified column in the exhibit for targeted dental 
services that are provided to persons under the age of 18 under the medical assistance program. 
Requires the Department to actively monitor the contractual relationship between Managed Care 
Organizations (MCOs) and a dental administrator contracted by an MCO to provide dental services. 
Contains provisions concerning the Department's adoption of appropriate data and measures; the 
inclusion of certain dental performance measures in the Department's Health Plan Comparison Tool and 
Illinois Medicaid Plan Report Card; and the collection of information about the types of contracted, broad-
based care coordination occurring between a MCO and any dental administrator. Prohibits a health plan 
from attempting to limit the right of medical assistance recipients to obtain dental services from a qualified 
Medicaid provider. Prohibits the Department from adopting a rule or entering into a contract that prohibits 
a licensed dentist or dental hygienist from receiving reimbursement under the medical assistance 
program for a dental encounter. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Human Services 

 

 
SB 2438  
 

Short Description:  LABOR REL-FINANCIAL ABILITY 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chuck Weaver-Steven M. Landek 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Public Labor Relations Act. Provides that if a unit of local government, as an 
employer, and public employees provide for arbitration of impasses, the employer's financial ability to 
fund the proposals based on existing available resources shall be given primary consideration, provided 
that such ability is not predicated on an assumption that lines of credit or reserve funds are available or 
that the employer may or will receive or develop new sources of revenue or increase existing sources of 
revenue. Modifies the factors by which an arbitration panel shall base its findings, opinions, and order on 
a new agreement or amendment upon. Provides that arbitration decisions regarding peace officers, fire 
fighters, and fire department or fire district paramedic matters under the Act shall not include residency 
requirements. Amends the Illinois Educational Labor Relations Act. With respect to collective bargaining 
between an educational employer (other than the Chicago school district) and an exclusive representative 
of its employees, provides that when making wage and benefit determinations during interest arbitration, 
the employer's financial ability to fund the proposals based on existing available resources shall be given 
primary consideration, provided that such ability is not predicated on an assumption that lines of credit or 
reserve funds are available or that the employer may or will receive or develop new sources of revenue or 
increase existing sources of revenue. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/7/2018 Senate Assigned to Labor 

 



 
SB 2439  
 

Short Description:  LICENSES-EDUCATIONAL LOAN-ISAC 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Scott M. Bennett-Michael Connelly-Thomas Cullerton, Ira I. Silverstein-Melinda Bush, William R. 
Haine, Iris Y. Martinez and Omar Aquino 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends various acts to remove provisions allowing or requiring licensing authorities to revoke 
professional licenses for defaulting on an educational loan provided by or guaranteed by the Illinois 
Student Assistance Commission. Effective immediately. 
 
Senate Committee Amendment No. 1 
     Replaces everything after the enacting clause. Reinserts the introduced bill with the following changes: 
Creates the Career Preservation and Student Loan Repayment Act. Provides that no governmental 
agency or board established under a statute of this State may impose or refer a matter to any other 
governmental agency to impose a denial, refusal to renew, suspension, revocation, or other disciplinary 
action against a professional or occupational licensee for his or her delinquency, default, or other failure 
to perform on an educational loan or scholarship provided by or guaranteed by the Illinois Student 
Assistance Commission. Amends the Nursing Education Scholarship Law, the Illinois Athletic Trainers 
Practice Act, and the Illinois Roofing Industry Licensing Act to remove provisions allowing or requiring 
licensing authorities to revoke professional licenses for defaulting on an educational loan provided by or 
guaranteed by the Commission. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2442  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Public Health Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  IDPH-MAMMOGRAPHY INFORMATION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. John G. Mulroe-Ira I. Silverstein-Mattie Hunter-Linda Holmes-Patricia Van Pelt, Jacqueline Y. 
Collins, Julie A. Morrison, Terry Link, Scott M. Bennett, Kimberly A. Lightford, Pat McGuire, Steven M. 
Landek and Pamela J. Althoff 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Department of Public Health Powers and Duties Law of the Civil Administrative Code of 
Illinois. Provides that the Department of Public Health shall require every provider of mammography 
services to, if a patient's mammogram demonstrates dense breast tissue, provide notification to the 
patient in any summary of the mammography report sent to the patient pursuant to the federal 
Mammography Quality Standards Act that shall include, but not be limited to, certain information. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Public Health 

 

 
SB 2446  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-TELEPSYCHIATRY 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Julie A. Morrison 
 
House Sponsors 
(Rep. Natalie A. Manley) 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Requires the Department of 
Healthcare and Family Services to reimburse psychiatrists and federally qualified health centers for 
mental health services provided by advanced practice registered nurses certified in psychiatric and 
mental health nursing to medical assistance recipients via telepsychiatry. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/13/2018 House Arrived in House 

 

 
SB 2491  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Human Services Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-DENTAL HYGIENIST 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Dave Syverson 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Provides that a licensed dental 
hygienist working under the supervision of a dentist and employed by a federally qualified health center 
shall be reimbursed for dental services provided to medical assistance recipients at the federally qualified 
health center's encounter rate. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Human Services 

 

 
SB 2501  
 



Short Description:  INC TX-APPRENTICESHIP 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Jennifer Bertino-Tarrant-Chuck Weaver and Toi W. Hutchinson 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Creates an income tax credit for qualified education expenses 
incurred by employers on behalf of qualifying apprentices. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/7/2018 Senate Assigned to Revenue 

 

 
SB 2511  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Transportation Hearing Mar 13 2018 4:45PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  VEH CD-BACKUP LAMP-AMBER LIGHT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Karen McConnaughay, Kwame Raoul, Jil Tracy, Neil Anderson, Tim Bivins, Napoleon Harris, III, 
Cristina Castro-Martin A. Sandoval, Julie A. Morrison and Melinda Bush 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Vehicle Code. Provides that a back-up lamp equipped on a motor vehicle shall 
emit a white or amber light without glare. Effective January 1, 2019. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/7/2018 Senate Assigned to Transportation 

 

 
SB 2524  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Public Health Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  DISPOSAL-UNUSED ANTIBIOTICS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Department of Public Health Powers and Duties Law of the Civil Administrative Code of 
Illinois. Requires the Department of Public Health and Illinois Emergency Management Agency to 
collaborate to review and recommend new State laws for the disposal of unused antibiotics. Provides that 
the Department and Agency shall submit the recommendations to the General Assembly by January 1, 



2020. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Postponed - Public Health 

 

 
SB 2527  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Education Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  SCH CD-DUAL CREDIT-ONLINE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chuck Weaver-Jennifer Bertino-Tarrant 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the School Code. Prohibits a school board from limiting the number of dual credit courses a 
student may enroll in or the number of credits a student may receive from dual credit courses. Provides 
that if a school district establishes an online learning program for students (with exceptions), the school 
board may not limit (i) which students may participate in the program, (ii) the number of online courses a 
student may enroll in, or (iii) the number of credits a student may receive from online courses. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Education 

 

 
SB 2529  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Licensed Activities and Pensions Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  PROF REG-STUDENT LOAN DEFAULT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Steve Stadelman 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends various acts to remove provisions allowing or requiring licensing authorities to deny, not 
renew, suspend, or revoke professional licenses for defaulting on an educational loan or scholarship 
provided by or guaranteed by a State agency. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/15/2018 Senate Postponed - Licensed Activities and Pensions 

 



 
SB 2530  
 

Short Description:  UNIVERSITIES-ADMIN COSTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Thomas Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Public University Administrative Cost Decrease Act. Provides that all public universities 
shall annually submit a cost certification that certifies the level of spending dedicated to administrative 
costs for the current academic year. Provides that beginning with the 2020-2021 academic year, a Board 
of Trustees of a public university may not enact a budget that contains tuition or fee increases above that 
of the tuition and fees set in the 2017-2018 academic year until the Auditor General has verified that the 
cost certification submitted by the public university and due in the same calendar year of the proposed 
tuition or fees increase has shown a decrease of administrative costs by 25%. Amends the Illinois State 
Auditing Act. Makes related changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/7/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2533  
 
Committee Hearing: 
State Government Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  BUSINESS ENTERPRISE-POSTING 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Martin A. Sandoval-Kimberly A. Lightford 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Business Enterprise for Minorities, Women, and Persons with Disabilities Act. Provides 
that invoices submitted under the Act shall be posted on the State Comptroller's website. Provides that 
each such invoice shall indicate which provision of the contract or subcontract has been submitted for 
payment and the amount due. Provides that, upon payment, the invoice number and the voucher number 
shall be posted on the State Comptroller's website. Provides that the State Comptroller may enter into an 
intergovernmental agreement with the City of Chicago for the purpose of collecting and posting that 
information. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Postponed - State Government 

 

 
SB 2540  
 
Committee Hearing: 



Government Reform Hearing Mar 14 2018 2:00PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  GOVT ETHICS-STOP PAYMENT ORDER 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Jason A. Barickman-Thomas Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Officials and Employees Ethics Act. Provides that during the period beginning 
September 1 of the year of a general election and ending the day after the general election, the proper 
name or image of any executive branch constitutional officer or member of the General Assembly shall 
not be included in a public announcement on behalf of an executive branch constitutional officer, member 
of the General Assembly, or State agency related to any contract or grant awarded by a State agency. 
Amends the State Finance Act. Provides that appropriated funds may only be expended during the fiscal 
year for which they were appropriated. Provides that if any State agency receives a grant or contract from 
itself from appropriated funds, the recipient agency shall be restricted in the expenditure of these funds to 
the period during which the grantor agency was so restricted. Amends the Illinois Grant Funds Recovery 
Act. Provides that the Governor's Office of Management and Budget shall convene a subcommittee of the 
Illinois Single Audit Commission to provide recommendations to the General Assembly regarding the 
adoption of legislation. Amends the Grant Accountability and Transparency Act. Sets forth provisions 
concerning the stop payment system. Modifies a Section concerning the adoption of supplemental rules 
by the Governor's Office of Management and Budget. Modifies a Section concerning the annual report 
submitted by the Governor's Office of Management and Budget. Provides requirements for awarded 
grants. Sets forth provisions concerning the travel costs incurred by the employees of the recipient or 
subrecipient of an awarded grant. Requires nonprofit organizations to maintain State grant funds in an 
account which is separate from non-grant funds. Makes conforming changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/28/2018 Senate Postponed - Government Reform 

 

 
SB 2546  
 

Short Description:  EDU LABOR ACT-EMPLOYEE DEFN 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Daniel Biss 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Educational Labor Relations Act. Provides that the term "student" within the 
definition of "educational employee" or "employee" as used in the Act includes (rather than excludes) 
graduate students who are teaching assistants primarily performing duties that involve the delivery and 
support of instruction and all other graduate students. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/28/2018 Senate Postponed - Labor 

 

 



SB 2559  
 

Short Description:  EDU LOAN INFO PILOT PROGRAM 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Steve Stadelman 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Provides that, beginning with the 2019-2020 academic 
year, the Board of Higher Education shall develop a 3-year education loan information pilot program for 
use by each public institution of higher education that enrolls students who are eligible to receive financial 
aid. Defines "education loan". Provides that the program shall require that each public institution of higher 
education that receives education loan information for a student enrolled at the institution provide 
annually to the student or the parent or guardian of the student certain information relating to the 
education loans. Provides that a public institution of higher education is not liable for any representations 
made during the pilot program. Repeals the provision on June 1, 2023. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2569  
 

Short Description:  TIF-CITY OF SPRINGFIELD 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Andy Manar 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Tax Increment Allocation Redevelopment Act of the Illinois Municipal Code. Creates a tax 
increment allocation financing extension for an ordinance adopted on February 23, 1995 by the City of 
Springfield. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Assigned to Revenue 

 

 
SB 2587  
 

Short Description:  TELEHEALTH ACT-DENTIST 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Dave Syverson-Pamela J. Althoff 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Telehealth Act. Provides that "health care professionals" includes dentists. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/22/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 3rd Reading February 27, 2018 

 

 
SB 2597  
 

Short Description:  HGHER ED-ICCB&ISAC CONSOLIDATE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act, the Public Community College Act, and the Higher 
Education Student Assistance Act. Increases the membership of the Board of Higher Education and 
makes other changes to the Board's membership. Provides that all of the rights, powers, duties, and 
functions vested by law in the Illinois Community College Board and the Illinois Student Assistance 
Commission are transferred to the Board of Higher Education on January 1, 2019. Abolishes the Illinois 
Community College Board and the Illinois Student Assistance Commission and provides for the transfer 
of personnel and property on that date. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2603  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Licensed Activities and Pensions Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  MUSIC THERAPY LICENSING 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Laura M. Murphy 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Music Therapy Licensing and Practice Act. Provides for licensure of music therapists by 
the Department of Financial and Professional Regulation. Establishes the powers and duties of the 
Department, including prescribing rules defining what constitutes an appropriate curriculum for music 
therapy, reviewing the qualifications of applicants for licenses, investigating alleged violations of the Act, 
conducting hearings on disciplinary and other matters, and establishing a schedule of fees for the 
administration and enforcement of the Act. Establishes qualifications for licensure as a music therapist. 
Provides that a music therapist shall collaborate with other professionals when applicable in providing 
music therapy services. Provides that licenses issued under the Act shall be renewed biennially. 
Establishes the Music Therapy Advisory Committee. Establishes the powers and duties of the advisory 
committee, including advising the Department on all matters pertaining to licensure, education, and 
continuing education requirements for music therapists. Establishes grounds for discipline of a license. 
Provides for civil and criminal penalties for violations of the Act. Creates provisions concerning formal 



hearings, including transcripts of proceedings, appointment of hearing officers, subpoenas and 
depositions, and rehearings. Provides for judicial review of all final administrative decisions of the 
Department. Preempts home rule. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Postponed - Licensed Activities and Pensions 

 

 
SB 2606  
 

Short Description:  PROCURE-FOOD DONATION POLICY 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. John F. Curran, Cristina Castro-Jacqueline Y. Collins, Heather A. Steans, Patricia Van Pelt and 
Elgie R. Sims, Jr. 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that each State agency entering into or maintaining a 
contract for the purchase of food under the Code shall adopt a policy that permits the donation of leftover 
food procured by State funds. Provides that the policy shall address any daily food operations run by the 
agency, including one-time events, and shall contain a list of nearby soup kitchens, food pantries, and 
other non-profit organizations where leftover food can be donated. Requires each State agency to 
circulate its policy to all agency employees, and submit its food donation policy to the Department of 
Central Management Services on an annual basis beginning December 31, 2018. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2613  
 

Short Description:  AMERICAN-MADE VEHICLES 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Thomas Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Procurement of Domestic Products Act. Provides that all vehicles purchased or leased by 
a State agency must have a Vehicle Identification Number indicating that the vehicle was manufactured in 
the United States. Effective January 1, 2019. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Assigned to Transportation 

 

 



SB 2631  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Licensed Activities and Pensions Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  DENTAL-FACULTY LICENSE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Emil Jones, III 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Dental Practice Act. Changes references to "restricted faculty license" to 
references to "faculty license". Makes conforming changes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Postponed - Licensed Activities and Pensions 

 

 
SB 2653  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Licensed Activities and Pensions Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  PROF REG-STUDENT LOAN DEFAULT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Michael Connelly 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends various acts to remove provisions allowing or requiring licensing authorities to deny, not 
renew, suspend, or revoke professional licenses for defaulting on an educational loan or scholarship 
provided by or guaranteed by a State agency. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Assigned to Licensed Activities and Pensions 

 

 
SB 2816  
 

Short Description:  ST INTERNET SERVICE CONTRACTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Thomas Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that no State agency may contract with an Internet 
service provider for the provision of broadband Internet access service unless that provider certifies, 



under penalty of perjury, that it will not engage in specified activities concerning Internet access and use. 
Defines terms. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/13/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2822  
 

Short Description:  HIGHR ED-RELIGIOUS INSTITUTION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Dan McConchie-Kimberly A. Lightford-William R. Haine 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Private Business and Vocational Schools Act of 2012, the Private College Act, and the 
Academic Degree Act. Defines "religious institution" in these Acts. Provides that any religious institution 
(instead of any institution devoted entirely to the teaching of religion or theology) shall not be considered 
to be a private business and vocational school; makes related changes. Provides that no religious 
institution shall be subject to the educational requirements, standards, or demands contained in the 
Private College Act or the Academic Degree Act or in those Acts' administrative rules, and requires a 
religious institution to notify each of its students in writing that the religious degree being earned or course 
work earned at a religious, non-accredited, post-secondary educational institution may not transfer to 
other institutions. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading February 28, 2018 

 

 
SB 2844  
 

Short Description:  SCH CD-GROWING FUTURE EDUCATOR 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Omar Aquino-Cristina Castro-Terry Link-Michael Connelly, Kimberly A. Lightford, Jennifer Bertino-
Tarrant, Iris Y. Martinez, Martin A. Sandoval-Chuck Weaver, John F. Curran, Scott M. Bennett, Thomas 
Cullerton, David Koehler, Andy Manar and Melinda Bush 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the School Code. Requires the State Board of Education to establish and maintain the 
Growing Future Educators Program to train high school graduates who at one time have been identified 
as English learners and who are enrolled in an approved educator preparation program, among other 
qualifications, to become secondary language educators. Provides that each school district that chooses 
to participate in the Program shall partner with one public, regionally accredited institution of higher 
education in this State that offers a pre-approved educator preparation program and each qualified high 
school graduate participating in the program through the district must be enrolled at that institution in its 
educator preparation program. Provides that for each semester that a qualified high school graduate is 
participating in the program, the State Board shall issue the person a paraprofessional educator 



endorsement on an Educator License with Stipulations and the person must be employed as a part-time 
employee by the participating district as a paraprofessional working under the supervision of a district 
employee with a Professional Educator License. Sets forth provisions concerning funding, submitting 
program data, reporting to the General Assembly, and rulemaking. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 3rd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2845  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Thomas Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends various Acts relating to the governance of public universities and community colleges in 
Illinois. With respect to employment contracts entered into with the president or all chancellors of a public 
university or an employee of a community college district, provides that severance under the contract may 
not exceed 6 months (rather than one year) of salary and applicable benefits. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2846  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Human Services Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  DCFS-TUITION & FEE WAIVERS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Cristina Castro-Iris Y. Martinez, Emil Jones, III-John J. Cullerton and David Koehler 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Children and Family Services Act. Makes post-secondary education tuition and fee 
waivers available to youth for whom the Department of Children and Family Services has court-ordered 
legal responsibility, youth who aged out of care at age 18 or older, or youth formerly under care who have 
been adopted and were the subject of an adoption assistance agreement or who have been placed in 
private guardianship and were the subject of a subsidized guardianship agreement. Requires applicants 
to have earned a high school diploma from an accredited institution or a high school equivalency 
certificate or have met the State criteria for high school graduation before the start of the school year for 
which they are applying for the waivers. Limits the tuition and fee waivers to persons under the age of 26 
and provides that waivers shall be available to a student for at least the first 5 years the student is 
enrolled in a community college, university, or college maintained by the State. Provides that the age 
requirement and 5-year cap on tuition and fee waivers shall be waived and eligibility extended for 



applicants or students who were unable to enroll in a qualifying post-secondary school or complete an 
academic term because the student: (i) was called into active duty with the United States Armed Forces; 
(ii) was deployed for service in the United States Public Health Service Commissioned Corps; or (iii) 
volunteered in the Peace Corps or the AmeriCorps. Permits the Department to provide the student with a 
stipend to cover maintenance and school expenses during the academic years to supplement the 
student's earnings. Requires the Department to develop outreach programs to ensure qualifying youths 
are aware of the availability of the tuition and fee waivers. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Human Services 

 

 
SB 2863  
 

Short Description:  UNEMP INS-WRKR COMP RATES 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Kwame Raoul, Cristina Castro and Elgie R. Sims, Jr. 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Employer's Liability Rates Article of the Illinois Insurance Code. Provides that a rate is 
excessive if it is likely to produce a long run profit that is unreasonably high for the insurance provided or 
if expenses are unreasonably high in relation to the services rendered. Makes changes regarding 
competitive markets exists and disapproval of rates under specified circumstances. Amends the Workers' 
Compensation Act. Provides that accidental injuries sustained while traveling to or from work do not arise 
out of and in the course of employment. Permits an employer to file with the Illinois Workers' 
Compensation Commission a workers' compensation safety program or a workers' compensation return 
to work program implemented by the employer. Provides that (i) injuries to the shoulder shall be 
considered injuries to part of the arm and (ii) injuries to the hip shall be considered injuries to part of the 
leg. Contains provisions concerning repetitive and cumulative injuries; permanent partial disability 
determinations; annual reports by the Commission concerning self-insurance for workers' compensation 
in Illinois; and duties of the Workers' Compensation Premium Rates Task Force. Makes additional 
changes to the Workers' Compensation Act. Provides for an evidence-based drug formulary. Requires an 
annual investigation of procedures covered for ambulatory surgical centers and the establishment of a fee 
schedule. Changes a waiting period for benefits for certain firefighters, emergency medical technicians, 
and paramedics. Changes compensation computations for subsequent injuries to the same part of the 
spine. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 3rd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2882  
 

Short Description:  TELEHEALTH ACT-TECH 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Antonio Muñoz 



 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Telehealth Act. Makes a technical change concerning the short title of the Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2904  
 

Short Description:  PHYSICIAN ASSISTANT-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Heather A. Steans and Cristina Castro-Pamela J. Althoff-Iris Y. Martinez 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Physician Assistant Practice Act of 1987. Removes language providing that a 
collaborating physician may collaborate with a maximum of 5 full-time equivalent physician assistants. 
Amends the Medical Practice Act of 1987, removes language providing that a physician licensed to 
practice medicine in all its branches may enter into collaborative agreements with no more than 5 full-time 
equivalent physician assistants except in a hospital, hospital affiliate, or ambulatory surgical treatment 
center. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2905  
 

Short Description:  COMMUNITY COLLEGE ACT-VARIOUS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pat McGuire 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Public Community College Act. Provides that the Illinois Community College Board may, 
in collaboration with community colleges, furnish information for State and federal accountability 
purposes, promote student and institutional improvement, and meet research needs. Provides that the 
Board may review and approve or disapprove (rather than participate in and recommend approval or 
disapproval of) any contract or agreement that community colleges enter into with any organization, 
association, educational institution, or government agency to provide educational services and may 
monitor the performance under any contract. Requires the board of trustees of each community college 
district to file a written or electronic copy of its annual budget with the Board. Provides that any graduate 
from a recognized high school or student otherwise qualified to attend a public community college and 
residing outside a community college district may attend any recognized public community college in this 
State at the tuition rate of a student residing in the district; requires the Board to pay the community 
college the difference between the in-district and out-of-district tuition amounts. Provides that, for tuition 
purposes, a student shall be classified as a resident of a community college district after establishing the 



30-day residency requirement of the district. Repeals provisions governing indemnification, deferred 
maintenance grants, the College and Career Readiness Pilot Program, a directory of graduating 
vocational and technical school students, and other items. Makes other changes. Amends the State 
Finance Act to make a conforming change. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2906  
 

Short Description:  COMPTROLLER-MINORITY BUSINESS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Karen McConnaughay 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Comptroller Act. Requires the Comptroller to work with the Department of Central 
Management Services to fulfill his or her responsibilities under the Minority Contractor Opportunity 
Initiative. Provides for specified aspects of the Minority Contractor Opportunity Initiative to be 
administered by the Department of Central Management Services (rather than the Comptroller). Requires 
any bidder or offeror awarded a contract of $1,000 or more under specified Sections of the Illinois 
Procurement Code to pay a fee of $50 (currently, $15) annually for each year of the contract to cover 
expenses related to the operation of the Business Enterprise Program, and for the administration of the 
Initiative. Requires the fee to be paid into the Business Enterprise Program Fund (currently, the 
Comptroller's Administrative Fund). Amends the Business Enterprise for Minorities, Women, and Persons 
with Disabilities Act. Requires a copy of a proposed contract to be provided to the Secretary of the 
Business Enterprise Council within 14 days of execution before work may be commenced. Modifies 
enforcement provisions. Provides requirements for prompt payments to subcontractors. Specifies 
contracts subject to Business Enterprise Program goal analysis. Amends the State Finance Act to create 
the Business Enterprise Program Fund as a special fund in the State treasury. Makes other changes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/14/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 2927  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-VETERAN ACT-REPORT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pat McGuire 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Higher Education Veterans Service Act. Provides that each public college or university 
that is required to have a Coordinator of Veterans and Military Personnel Student Services shall report to 
the Board of Higher Education information on the its efforts in attracting, recruiting, and retaining veterans 
and military personnel at the institution. Effective immediately. 



 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 2942  
 

Short Description:  ENERGY PERFORMANCE CONTRACTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Energy Performance Contracting Act. Requires each governmental unit to implement cost-
effective conservation improvements and maintain efficient operation of its facilities in order to minimize 
energy consumption and related environmental impacts, and reduce operating costs. Provides that any 
governmental unit may enter into an energy performance contract with a qualified energy service provider 
to produce utility savings or operating and maintenance cost-savings. Designates the Smart Energy 
Design Assistance Center as the lead agency for the development and promotion of a program of 
performance contracts in governmental units under the Act, and provides requirements and duties for that 
agency. Provides for the selection process of qualified energy service providers. Provides for audits, 
payments, and term requirements for energy performance contracts entered into under the Act. Provides 
for the monitoring and reporting of energy consumption and cost-savings under an energy performance 
contract. Provides for the use of savings from performance contracts. Provides that the provisions of the 
Act shall prevail and control over conflicting provisions of law, and that any conflicting provisions of any 
statute enacted prior to the Act are hereby repealed. Defines terms. Amends the Illinois Procurement 
Code to make conforming changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Energy and Public Utilities 

 

 
SB 2954  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-SURS-EMPLOYER CONTRIB 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Omar Aquino 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Universities Article of the Illinois Pension Code. Provides that if an employer fails to 
transmit required contributions to the System for more than 120 days after the payment of those 
contributions is due, the Board may certify to the State Comptroller the amount of those delinquent 
employer contributions and the State Comptroller shall deduct the certified amount from State funds to 
the employer and remit the amount deducted to the System. Provides that if State funds from which those 
deductions may be made are not available or if deductions are delayed for longer than 120 days after the 
date of the certification to the Comptroller, the Board may proceed against the employer to recover the 
amounts of such delinquent payments in the appropriate circuit court. Adds similar provisions if the 



employer is a community college district. Makes other changes. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 2964  
 

Short Description:  NAMING PUBLIC BLDGS-OFFICIALS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Wm. Sam McCann 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Naming Public Buildings for Elected Officials Act. Provides that no public building or other 
public asset owned or exclusively leased by the State or by any political subdivision of the State shall be 
named in honor of any elected official, unless that official has either retired from public office for a 
minimum of 10 consecutive years or is deceased for a minimum of 5 years. Defines "elected official" and 
"public office". 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Executive 

 

 
SB 2968  
 

Short Description:  COMMUNITY COLLEGE-CONTRACTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pamela J. Althoff 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Public Community College Act. Provides that the board of trustees of a community 
college district may enter into a contract for goods or services procured from a competitively bid group 
purchase contract without adhering to the competitively bid contract requirements under the Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading February 28, 2018 

 

 
SB 3007  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Judiciary Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 



Short Description:  PERSONAL INFORMATION REPORT GA 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Kwame Raoul-Michael E. Hastings 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Personal Information Protection Act. Provides that a data collector required to report 
breaches to more than 100 Illinois residents as a result of a single breach must also report to the Attorney 
General. Provides that the Attorney General shall report annually to the General Assembly specified 
information concerning breaches of data security by February 1 of each year. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Judiciary 

 

 
SB 3031  
 

Short Description:  GREEN BUILDINGS-REQUIREMENTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chuck Weaver 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Energy Efficient Building Act. Provides that the International Code Council's International 
Energy Conservation Code, as adopted by the Capital Development Board, shall also apply to certain 
State facilities beginning on the effective date of the amendatory Act. Amends the Green Buildings Act. 
Removes provisions providing that construction and major renovation projects must achieve the highest 
level of certification practical within the project budget. Provides that new State-funded building 
construction and major renovations of existing State-owned facilities must be designed to achieve, at a 
minimum, the silver certification of the Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design's rating system or 
an equivalent standard. Amends the Capital Development Board Act. Repeals a Section of the Act 
concerning the adoption of a statewide energy code. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 3032  
 

Short Description:  FINANCE-VOUCHER-DESIGNEE SIGNS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chuck Weaver 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Finance Act. In a Section providing that (i) any new contract, contract renewal, or 
order against a master contract in the amount of $250,000 or more in a fiscal year or (ii) any contract 
amendment or change to an existing contract that increases the value of the contract to or by $250,000 or 



more in a fiscal year shall be signed or approved in writing by the chief executive officer of the agency, 
the chief legal counsel of the agency, and the chief fiscal officer of the agency, provides that those 
contracts, orders, and amendments may also be signed by designees of those officers. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  3/1/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading March 13, 2018 

 

 
SB 3047  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Higher Education Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL ** Canceled **  
 

Short Description:  GROW STEM TEACHERS ACT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Andy Manar-Kimberly A. Lightford-Iris Y. Martinez 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Grow Your Own STEM and Vocational Education Teachers Act. Requires a public 
university to waive any tuition, fees, and on-campus housing costs of a student who agrees to pursue a 
minimum of a bachelor's degree in science, technology, engineering, or mathematics for a teaching 
occupation that includes, but is not limited to, mathematics, natural sciences, or career and vocational 
education in the areas of technology teacher, industrial arts teacher, trade teacher, health care teacher, 
or information technology teacher and maintains a 3.0 cumulative grade point average. Provides that the 
student shall agree to fully reimburse the public university if the student fails to teach at least 3 years at 
an Illinois high school or at least 5 years at an Illinois public institution of higher education. Provides for 
funding. Requires the Board of Higher Education to adopt rules it determines are necessary for the 
administration of the Act. Effective July 1, 2020. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3049  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Human Services Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  MEDICAID-TELEHEALTH SERVICES 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Andy Manar 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Medical Assistance Article of the Illinois Public Aid Code. Requires the Department of 
Healthcare and Family Services to reimburse psychiatrists, federally qualified health centers as defined in 



the Social Security Act, clinical psychologists, clinical social workers, advanced practice registered nurses 
certified in psychiatric and mental health nursing, and mental health professionals and clinicians 
authorized by Illinois law to provide mental health services to recipients via telehealth (rather than 
psychiatrists and federally qualified health centers). Requires the Department to reimburse any Medicaid 
certified eligible facility or provider organization that acts as the location of the patient at the time a 
telehealth service is rendered, including substance abuse centers licensed by the Department of Human 
Services' Division of Alcoholism and Substance Abuse. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Human Services 

 

 
SB 3058  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Higher Education Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL ** Canceled **  
 

Short Description:  UNDERREPRESENTED STUDENTS ACT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Kimberly A. Lightford-Elgie R. Sims, Jr.-Jacqueline Y. Collins, Bill Cunningham, Omar Aquino, Iris Y. 
Martinez, Martin A. Sandoval and Patricia Van Pelt-Mattie Hunter 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Bridge Program for Underrepresented Students Act. Defines terms. Provides that each 
public university in this State may establish a Bridge Program for underrepresented students. Specifies 
program requirements. Provides that a public university that establishes a Bridge Program shall, on or 
before September 1, 2019 and on or before September 1 of each subsequent year, publish on its website 
and make available to the public a report on the Program. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Postponed - Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3071  
 

Short Description:  HGHER ED-DIVERSE FACULTY GRANT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Tom Rooney 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Diversifying Higher Education Faculty in Illinois Act. Provides that the Program Board 
created to administer the grant program authorized by the Act shall be comprised of 11 (rather than 21) 
members. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  



Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Placed on Calendar Order of 2nd Reading February 28, 2018 

 

 
SB 3073  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Licensed Activities and Pensions Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  PEN CD-ACCEL BENEFIT PAYMENT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Paul Schimpf 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Employee, State Universities, and Downstate Teachers Articles of the Illinois 
Pension Code. Requires those Systems to offer certain inactive members the opportunity to elect to 
receive an accelerated pension benefit payment equal to 70% of the net present value of their pension 
benefits in lieu of receiving any pension benefit. Provides that if a person elects to receive an accelerated 
pension benefit payment, his or her credits and creditable service under that Article shall be terminated 
upon receipt of the accelerated pension benefit payment; except that the terminated service credit shall 
be used for the purposes of determining participation and benefits under the State Employees Group 
Insurance Act of 1971. Provides that a person who receives an accelerated pension benefit payment 
must direct the System to pay all of that payment as a rollover into another qualified retirement plan or 
account. Contains provisions concerning return to active service; rulemaking; and qualified plan status. 
Amends the State Employees Group Insurance Act of 1971 to make related changes. Requires the 
Authority to issue bonds if the amount of the accelerated pension benefit payments exceed the amount 
appropriated to each System for those payments. Amends the General Obligation Bond Act. Authorizes 
$250,000,000 in State Pension Obligation Acceleration Bonds to be sold to pay for accelerated pension 
benefit payments to eligible persons. Amends the State Pension Funds Continuing Appropriation Act to 
create a continuing appropriation for payments on those Bonds. Amends the State Finance Act to create 
the State Pension Obligation Acceleration Bond Fund. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Licensed Activities and Pensions 

 

 
SB 3090  
 

Short Description:  IBHE-PUBLIC COLLEGE-CLOSING 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Jim Oberweis 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Provides that when a public institution of higher education 
proposes to discontinue operations, it shall file with the Board the original or legible true copies of all 
academic records of the institution. Provides for the specific contents of the records required to be filed. 
Provides that where it appears to the Board that any such records are in danger of being lost, hidden, 
destroyed, or otherwise made unavailable to the Board, the Board may seize and take possession of the 



records, on its own motion and without order of a court. Requires the Board to maintain a permanent file 
of all such records coming into its possession. Provides that, as an alternative to the deposit of records 
with the Board, the public institution of higher education may propose a different means for permanent 
retention of the records, subject to the approval of the Board. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3137  
 

Short Description:  $UNIVERSITY OF ILLINOIS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Scott M. Bennett 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Appropriates specified amounts to the Board of Trustees of the University of Illinois from various funds. 
Effective July 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Appropriations II 

 

 
SB 3138  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Judiciary Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 400 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  HGHR ED-STUDNT IDENTIY-PRIVATE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Scott M. Bennett 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Higher Education Student Assistance Act. Provides that the identity and address of a 
scholarship, grant, or financial assistance applicant or recipient under the Act is private information and is 
exempt from inspection and copying under the Freedom of Information Act. Makes conforming changes in 
the Freedom of Information Act. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Judiciary 

 

 



SB 3157  
 

Short Description:  INC TX-EDUCATION CREDIT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Omar Aquino 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Provides that each qualified teacher is entitled to an income tax 
credit in an aggregate amount equal to 50% of the tuition costs incurred by that teacher at a public 
university in the State. Provides that each qualified teacher may take no more than 20% of his or her 
aggregate credit amount in any taxable year. Provides that the term "qualified teacher" means an 
individual who (i) graduated from a public university in the State, (ii) is employed as a teacher in this State 
during the taxable year, and (iii) has been employed as a teacher in the State for at least 5 consecutive 
years as of the first day of the taxable year. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Revenue 

 

 
SB 3160  
 

Short Description:  ECONOMIC INTEREST STATEMENTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Karen McConnaughay-Heather A. Steans-Michael Connelly 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Governmental Ethics Act. Creates a uniform statement of economic interest form 
that must be completed by all persons who are required to file that form under the Act. Changes the 
nature of the required disclosures that must be made. Authorizes the Secretary of State to institute an 
electronic statement of economic interest filing system. Repeals a provision that established a separate 
form for persons required to file a statement of economic interests with county clerks. Provides 
applicability clause. Defines terms. Effective January 1, 2019, except that specified Sections take effect 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 3176  
 

Short Description:  HGHER ED-BOARD OF REGENTS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Dan McConchie 
 



Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Budget Law of the Civil Administrative Code of Illinois. Provides that, beginning with 
the fiscal year 2020 budget, the budget submitted by the Governor shall include one or more line items 
appropriating moneys to the Board of Regents. Provides that all appropriations for public universities shall 
be made to the Board of Regents. Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Creates the Board of 
Regents to allocate funds to public universities based on a funding formula recommended by the Board of 
Higher Education. Provides for the membership of the Board. Provides that the boards of trustees of 
public universities shall submit to the Board of Regents no later than the 15th day of November of each 
year their budget proposals for the operation and capital needs of the institutions under their governance 
or supervision for the ensuing fiscal year. Provides that the Board of Higher Education may require the 
elimination of any program of instruction, research, or public service at a public university that exhibits a 
trend of low performance or low enrollment. Provides that the Board of Higher Education shall prepare a 
comprehensive statewide plan to increase efficiency and enrollment in public institutions of higher 
education. Specifies the plan requirements. Prohibits the Board of Regents from providing any funds to a 
public university that does not adhere to the plan. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3185  
 
Committee Hearing: 
State Government Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  FINANCE-ST AGENCY GRANT MAKING 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pamela J. Althoff 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Grant Accountability and Transparency Act. Modifies a Section concerning the adoption 
of federal rules applicable to grants and provides that specified provisions do not apply to for-profit 
subrecipients because for-profit subrecipients are not subject to the requirements of a specified provision 
of the Code of Federal Regulations. Provides that if a Program Audit Guide is not available, the State 
awarding agency must prepare a Program Audit Guide in accordance with the audit requirements of 
specified provisions of the Code of Federal Regulations. Requires the Governor's Office of Management 
and Budget to adopt supplemental rules pertaining to, among other subjects, specific conditions for 
individual recipients, including (rather than requiring) the use of a fiscal agent and additional corrective 
conditions. Applies provisions in the Code of Federal Regulations concerning federal agencies that make 
federal awards to non-federal entities to State grant-making agencies under the Act. Provides that the 
Grant Accountability and Transparency Unit shall be responsible for providing technical assistance and 
assuring the Administrative Code proposed by State grant agencies comply with the Act. Repeals the 
Section specifying a repeal date for the Act. Makes other changes. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to State Government 

 

 



SB 3190  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Education Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  DUAL CREDIT-INITIATIVE COURSE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Jennifer Bertino-Tarrant-Chuck Weaver 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Dual Credit Quality Act. Requires a public university or community college, jointly with a 
high school, to grant dual credit to a student who completes a course under the Illinois Articulation 
Initiative General Education Core Curriculum package adopted by the public university or community 
college under the Illinois Articulation Initiative Act. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Education 

 

 
SB 3194  
 

Short Description:  INC TX-HIRE ILLINOIS CREDIT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Paul Schimpf-Pamela J. Althoff and Scott M. Bennett 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Income Tax Act. Creates the Hire Illinois Tax Credit. Provides that a business is 
eligible for a $500 tax credit against its withholding tax liability for each recent graduate of a public 
university in the State who is hired by the taxpayer within the incentive period and retained by the 
taxpayer for 12 consecutive months. Provides that the $500 tax credit may be taken in both the year the 
qualified employee is hired and for each year of the next 4 years the qualified employee is retained by the 
taxpayer for 12 consecutive months. Provides 2 ways the taxpayer may take the $500 tax credit. Provides 
that the Department of Commerce and Economic Opportunity shall limit the monetary amount of these tax 
credits to $25,000,000. Provides for procedures for a business to apply for a certificate of eligibility for the 
credit and for procedures to apply for a tax credit certificate. Grants the Department of Commerce and 
Economic Opportunity the powers necessary or convenient to administer the tax credit. Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Revenue 

 

 
SB 3209  
 

Short Description:  CDB-HIGHER EDUCATION 



 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Antonio Muñoz 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Capital Development Board Act. Provides that the Capital Development Board has the 
power to construct and repair, or to contract for and supervise the construction and repair of, buildings 
under the control or for the use of any public institution of higher education when non-appropriated funds 
are used and both the Capital Development Board and the public institution of higher education mutually 
agree to that construction or supervision. Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Appropriations II 

 

 
SB 3288  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Higher Education Hearing Mar 13 2018 3:15PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL ** Canceled **  
 

Short Description:  UNIVERSITY-SURPLUS REAL ESTATE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Elgie R. Sims, Jr. 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the State Property Control Act. Provides that the Board of Trustees of any public institution of 
higher education in this State is authorized to dispose of surplus real estate of that public institution of 
higher education. Specifies the manner in which a Board of Trustees may dispose of surplus real estate. 
Provides that a Board of Trustees may retain the proceeds from the sale, lease, or other transfer of all or 
any part of the real estate deemed surplus real estate in a separate account in the treasury of the 
institution for the purpose of deferred maintenance and emergency repair of institution property. Requires 
the Auditor General to examine the separate account to ensure the use or deposit of the proceeds in a 
manner consistent with the stated purpose. Defines "public institution of higher education". Effective 
immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3370  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 BHE OCE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. William E. Brady 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 



     Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Higher Education and 
the Illinois Math and Science Academy for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General 
Funds $229,022,200; Other State Funds $4,980,000; Federal Funds $5,500,000; Total $239,502,200. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 3374  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 NEIU OCE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. William E. Brady 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of 
Northeastern Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds 
$33,209,000. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 3378  
 

Short Description:  $FY19 SIU OCE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. William E. Brady 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Makes appropriations for the ordinary and contingent expenses of the Board of Trustees of Southern 
Illinois University for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2018, as follows: General Funds $179,913,800; 
Other State Funds $1,269,000; Total $181,182,800. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/16/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
SB 3390  
 

Short Description:  EQUAL PAY ACT-WAGE HISTORY 

 
Senate Sponsors 



Sen. Cristina Castro, Heather A. Steans-Linda Holmes-Kimberly A. Lightford-Toi W. Hutchinson, 
Jacqueline Y. Collins, Melinda Bush, Omar Aquino, Laura M. Murphy-Iris Y. Martinez and Antonio Muñoz 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Equal Pay Act of 2003. Prohibits an employer from: (i) screening job applicants based on 
their wage or salary history, (ii) requiring that an applicant's prior wages satisfy minimum or maximum 
criteria, and (iii) requesting or requiring as a condition of being interviewed or as a condition of continuing 
to be considered for an offer of employment that an applicant disclose prior wages or salary. Prohibits an 
employer from seeking the salary, including benefits or other compensation or salary history, of a job 
applicant from any current or former employer, with some exceptions. Limits defenses. Provides for 
penalties and injunctive relief. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Labor 

 

 
SB 3533  
 
Committee Hearing: 
State Government Hearing Mar 14 2018 3:00PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  PROCURE-RENEW ENERGY RESOURCES 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Pamela J. Althoff 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Illinois Procurement Code. Provides that, among other types of contracts, renewable 
energy resources contracts and leases may be entered into for a period of time deemed to be in the best 
interest of the State but not exceeding 15 years inclusive of proposed contract or lease renewals. Makes 
conforming changes. Defines "renewable energy resources". Effective immediately. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to State Government 

 

 
SB 3547  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Veterans Affairs Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 409 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  SERVICE-MEMBER EMPLOYMENT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Thomas Cullerton 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Creates the Service-Member Employment and Reemployment Rights Act. Contains provisions 



concerning matters relevant to the employment rights of service-members, including employment 
protections, additional benefits for public employee members of a reserve component, prohibitions on 
discrimination, a notice of rights and duties, violations, enforcement, remedies, and rulemaking. Provides 
that the Attorney General shall appoint an Illinois Service-Member Employment and Reemployment 
Rights Act Advocate to carry out various duties related to the Act. Provides that in times of national or 
State emergency, the Governor may extend the protections of the Act. Limits the concurrent exercise of 
power by home rule units. Makes corresponding and related changes throughout the statutes. Repeals 
the Military Leave of Absence Act, the Public Employee Armed Services Rights Act, the Municipal 
Employees Military Active Duty Act, and the Local Government Employees Benefits Continuation Act. 
Amends the Service Member's Employment Tenure Act to change the short title to the Service Member's 
Tenure Act. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Veterans Affairs 

 

 
SB 3564  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-LEGACY SCHOLARSHIPS 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Higher Education Student Assistance Act. Requires the Illinois Student Assistance 
Commission to receive and consider applications for legacy scholarships. Provides that an applicant is 
eligible for a scholarship if, among other conditions, (i) he or she has been accepted for undergraduate 
enrollment at a public university in this State, (ii) he or she is considered a non-resident of this State for 
tuition purposes, and (iii) he or she has a parent or step-parent who has earned a bachelor's, graduate, 
doctorate, or professional degree from the university and is an active member of the university's alumni 
association. Sets forth provisions concerning the amount and payment of scholarship assistance, the 
automatic renewal of scholarships, administration, and rulemaking. Effective July 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3565  
 

Short Description:  BD HIGHER ED-AUTO ADMISSION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Requires the Board of Higher Education (i) to ensure that 
any high school student in this State with a 3.0 cumulative grade point average or better on a 4.0 scale 
(or the equivalent on a 5.0 scale) receives access to the opportunity of higher education and (ii) to 



guarantee admission to a public university; requires cooperation by the State Board of Education and 
public universities. Requires all high schools to provide the time, opportunity, and guidance to fill out a 
Free Application for Federal Student Aid for any student wishing to do so. Effective July 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3566  
 

Short Description:  BD HIGHER ED-UNIFORM ADMISSION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Requires the Board of Higher Education to establish a 
uniform admission process online, which must be used at all public institutions of higher education; sets 
forth what components this admission process must include. Effective July 1, 2018. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3567  
 

Short Description:  MAP GRANT-FRESHMAN PREFERENCE 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Higher Education Student Assistance Act. With regard to the Monetary Award Program, 
provides that a student who otherwise meets the award renewal requirements under the Program is not 
required to file a Free Application for Federal Student Aid to obtain the renewal of an award. Provides 
that, beginning with the 2020-2021 academic year, a grant awarded to a first-time, full-time freshman of 
an institution of higher learning shall be guaranteed for renewal until the grant recipient completes a 
baccalaureate degree or the equivalent of 135 credit hours if the recipient otherwise meets the grant 
renewal requirements and remains enrolled at the same institution of higher learning until the degree or 
credit hours are completed. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 



SB 3568  
 

Short Description:  U OF I-INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the University of Illinois Act. Provides that notwithstanding any other provisions of law, the 
University may form one or more limited liability companies to own any current or future intellectual 
property attributable to the University pursuant to the Limited Liability Company Act. Requires the State to 
maintain a 51% ownership interest in any limited liability company formed. Allows the intellectual property 
to be held as a tenancy-in-common with all entities that hold an ownership interest in a company. 
Requires the payment of distributions. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
SB 3569  
 

Short Description:  HIGHER ED-TUITION WAIVER LIMIT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Chapin Rose 
 
Synopsis As Introduced 
     Amends the Board of Higher Education Act. Provides that the Board of Higher Education may not limit 
the amount of tuition revenue that a public university may waive. Repeals provisions regarding tuition 
waiver limitations in various Acts relating to the governance of public universities in Illinois. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/27/2018 Senate Assigned to Higher Education 

 

 
HR 27  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION PENSION COST SHIFT 

 
House Sponsors 
Rep. David McSweeney-Sam Yingling-Jerry Costello, II-Jay Hoffman-Mary E. Flowers, Norine K. 
Hammond, Allen Skillicorn, Bill Mitchell, Linda Chapa LaVia, Cynthia Soto, Stephanie A. Kifowit, Sara 
Wojcicki Jimenez, Katie Stuart, Terri Bryant, LaToya Greenwood, Sue Scherer, Deb Conroy, David B. 
Reis, Natalie A. Manley, John Cavaletto, C.D. Davidsmeyer, Charles Meier, Randy E. Frese, Michael 
Halpin, John Connor, Emanuel Chris Welch, Anna Moeller, Tony McCombie, Will Guzzardi, Litesa E. 
Wallace, Peter Breen, Carol Ammons, Monica Bristow, Natalie Phelps Finnie, Kelly M. Burke, John M. 
Cabello, Daniel Swanson, Christine Winger, Luis Arroyo, Camille Y. Lilly, Mark Batinick, Jehan Gordon-
Booth, Nick Sauer, Chad Hays, Lawrence Walsh, Jr., Steven A. Andersson, Thaddeus Jones, Barbara 



Wheeler, Jonathan Carroll, Steven Reick, David A. Welter, Joe Sosnowski, Dave Severin, Keith R. 
Wheeler, Lindsay Parkhurst, Brad Halbrook, Rita Mayfield, Arthur Turner, Marcus C. Evans, Jr., Nicholas 
K Smith, David S. Olsen, Martin J. Moylan, Keith P. Sommer, Juliana Stratton, William Davis, Kathleen 
Willis, Jerry Lee Long and Dan Brady 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      States the opinion of the Illinois House of Representatives that the proposed educational pension cost 
shift from the State of Illinois to local school districts, community colleges, and institutions of higher 
education is financially wrong. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  9/28/2017 House Rule 19(b) / Re-referred to Rules Committee 

 

 
SR 1413  
 
Committee Hearing: 
Education Hearing Mar 13 2018 1:30PM Capitol 212 Springfield, IL  
 

Short Description:  EDUCATION PENSION COST SHIFT 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Thomas Cullerton-Wm. Sam McCann-Michael Connelly-John F. Curran and Karen McConnaughay 

Synopsis As Introduced 
      States the opinion of the Illinois Senate that the proposed educational pension cost shift from the 
State of Illinois to local school districts, community colleges, and institutions of higher education is 
financially wrong. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  2/21/2018 Senate Assigned to Education 

 

 
SJRCA 18  
 

Short Description:  INCOME TAX-EDUCATION 

 
Senate Sponsors 
Sen. Laura M. Murphy 



Synopsis As Introduced 
      Proposes to amend the Revenue Article of the Illinois Constitution. Provides for an additional tax on 
individuals in an amount equal to 3% of income greater than $1,000,000 for the taxable year. Provides 
that 75% of the revenue collected from the tax shall be distributed to school districts solely to provide for 
kindergarten through grade 12 education, and 25% of the revenue collected from the tax shall be 
distributed to public institutions of higher education. Effective upon being declared adopted. 
 

Last Action  

Date Chamber  Action 

  1/10/2018 Senate Referred to Assignments 

 

 
Totals: 225 - (House Bills: 124) (Senate Bills: 98) (Other Bills: 3) 

 


